
ILLINOIS 
REGISTER   

PUBLISHED BY JESSE WHITE • SECRETARY OF STATE 

Index Department
Administrative Code Division

Printed on recycledpaper 

PUBLISHED BY ALEXI GIANNOULIAS • SECRETARY OF STATE

Volume 48, Issue 34

August 23, 2024

Pages 12658-12932

Index Department 
Administrative Code Division 
111 E. Monroe St. 
Springfield, IL 62756 
217-782-7017

Rules of  
Governmental Agencies

2024

Printed by authority of the State of Illinois. August � 70 � I Pub 35.1



 

 i 

TABLE OF CONTENTS 

 

August 23, 2024   Volume 48, Issue 34 

 

PROPOSED RULES 

CAPITAL DEVELOPMENT BOARD 

Selection of Architects/Engineers (A/E) 

 44 Ill. Adm. Code 1000..........................................................................12658 

Early Childhood Construction Grant Rules 

 71 Ill. Adm. Code 43..............................................................................12670 

COMMERCE AND ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY, DEPARTMENT OF 

Business Exit Survey 

 14 Ill. Adm. Code 530............................................................................12684 

HUMAN SERVICES, DEPARTMENT OF  

Supplemental Nutrition Assistance Program (SNAP) 

 89 Ill. Adm. Code 121............................................................................12688 

STATE FIRE MARSHAL, OFFICE OF THE 

Sprayed Fire-Resistant Material Applicator Registration Rules 

 41 Ill. Adm. Code 255............................................................................12707 

ADOPTED RULES 

ATTORNEY GENERAL, OFFICE OF THE 

Crimes and Offenses, Impersonating Officer, Advertisements (Repealer) 

 14 Ill. Adm. Code 440............................................................................12716 

Illinois Estate and Generation-Skipping Transfer Tax Return 

 86 Ill. Adm. Code 2000..........................................................................12718 

FINANCIAL AND PROFESSIONAL REGULATION, DEPARTMENT OF 

Marriage and Family Therapy Licensing Act 

 68 Ill. Adm. Code 1283..........................................................................12727 

Clinical Psychologist Licensing Act 

 68 Ill. Adm. Code 1400..........................................................................12770 

Registered Surgical Assistant and Registered Surgical Technologist Title 

Protection Act 

 68 Ill. Adm. Code 1485..........................................................................12813 

STATE FIRE MARSHAL, OFFICE OF THE 

Petroleum Equipment Contractor Licensing 

 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172............................................................................12822 

General Requirements for Underground Storage Tanks and the Storage, 

Transportation, Sale, and Use of Petroleum and Other Regulated  

Substances 

 41 Ill. Adm. Code 174............................................................................12829 

Technical Requirements for Underground Storage Tanks and the Storage, 

Transportation, Sale and Use of Petroleum and Other Regulated  

Substances 

 41 Ill. Adm. Code 175............................................................................12838 



 

 ii 

Administrative Requirements for Underground Storage Tanks and the  

Storage, Transportation, Sale and Use of Petroleum and Other Regulated 

Substances 

 41 Ill. Adm. Code 176............................................................................12876 

Fire Station Rehabilitation and Construction Grant Program 

 41 Ill. Adm. Code 296............................................................................12890 

PUBLIC HEARINGS ON PROPOSED RULES 

NATURAL RESOURCES, DEPARTMENT OF 

Sport Fishing Regulations for the Waters of Illinois.....................................12909 

SECOND NOTICES RECEIVED 

JOINT COMMITTEE ON ADMINISTRATIVE RULES 

Second Notices Received...............................................................................12910 

EXECUTIVE ORDERS AND PROCLAMATIONS 

PROCLAMATIONS 

Chosen Few DJs Picnic and Festival Day 

 2024-199.................................................................................................12911 

Srebrenica Genocide Awareness Day 

 2024-200.................................................................................................12912 

Illinois Square Dance Week 

 2024-201.................................................................................................12912 

Summer Learning Week 

 2024-202.................................................................................................12913 

Korean War Veterans Armistice Day 

 2024-203.................................................................................................12914 

Richard James Oglesby Day 

 2024-204.................................................................................................12915 

National Farmers Market Week 

 2024-205.................................................................................................12915 

Sepsis Awareness Month 

 2024-206.................................................................................................12916 

Asian American, Native Hawaiian, and Pacific Islander Breastfeeding  

Week 

 2024-207.................................................................................................12917 

Black Breastfeeding Week 

 2024-208.................................................................................................12918 

Breastfeeding Month 

 2024-209.................................................................................................12919 

Illinois Blood Donation Day 

 2024-210.................................................................................................12920 

Indigenous Milk Medicine Breastfeeding Week 

 2024-211.................................................................................................12921 

National Community Health Center Week 

 2024-212.................................................................................................12922 

National Diaper Need Awareness Week 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12822 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

1) Heading of the Part:  Petroleum Equipment Contractor Licensing 

 

2) Code Citation:  41 Ill. Adm. Code 172 

 

3) Section Numbers:  Adopted Actions: 

172.40    Amendment 

172.50    Amendment 

 

4) Statutory Authority:  Implementing the Petroleum Equipment Contractors Licensing Act 

[225 ILCS 729] and authorized by Sections 25 and 73 of the Petroleum Equipment 

Contractors Licensing Act [225 ILCS 729/25 and 73]. 

 

5) Effective Date of Rule:  August 7, 2024 

 

6) Does this rulemaking contain an automatic repeal date?  No 

 

7) Does this rulemaking contain incorporations by reference?  No 

 

8) A copy of the Adopted Rules, including any matter incorporated by reference, are on file 

in the principal office of the State Fire Marshal, 1035 Stevenson Drive, Springfield, 

Illinois, and are available for public inspection at that location. 

 

9) Notice of Proposal published in the Illinois Register:  48 Ill. Reg. 3646; March 15, 2024  

 

10) Has JCAR issued a Statement of Objection to this rulemaking?  No 

 

11) Differences between Proposal and Final Version:  The JCAR agreed changes were as 

follows: 

 

--in subsection 172.40(b)(2), at the end of the paragraph, deleted "; and" and added a 

period; 

 

--in subsection 172.40(b)(4), the first sentence was changed to read: 

 

If seeking a license in the module that authorizes inspection and testing of UST 

equipment, the applicant shall designate the testing methods for which a license is 

sought and provide proof that the certified employee has passed the required 

OSFM-approved exam for the installation/retrofitting module or has the 

credentials and training as required by the manufacturer's recommended 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12823 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

procedures and instructions. The employing licensed contractor may certify the 

employee has the requisite credentials and training.   

 

--in subsection 172.50(g), "STSS" was changed to "Storage Tank Safety Specialist 

(STSS)" 

 

12) Have all the changes agreed upon by the agency and JCAR been made as indicated in the 

agreement issued by JCAR?  Yes 

 

13) Will this rulemaking replace an emergency rule currently in effect?  No 

 

14) Are there any rulemakings pending to this Part?  No 

 

15) Summary and purpose of rulemaking:  Requires a contractor seeking licensure to submit 

proof that its certified employees have a passing score on the required OSFM-approved 

exam for the installation/retrofitting module or are certified by the employing licensed 

contractor establishing that the certified employees have the credentials and training as 

required by the manufacturer's recommended procedures and instructions.  Makes non-

substantive changes.  

 

16) Information and questions regarding this rulemaking shall be directed to:   

 

Tom Andryk 

Division of Legal Counsel 

Office of the State Fire Marshal 

1035 Stevenson Dr. 

Springfield, IL  62703-4259 

 

217-785-5758 

Facsimile:  217-524-5487 

SFM.USTrulemaking@fdmail.sfm.illinois.gov 

 

The full text of the Adopted Amendments begins on the next page: 

  



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12824 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

TITLE 41:  FIRE PROTECTION 

CHAPTER I:  OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

PART 172 

PETROLEUM EQUIPMENT CONTRACTOR LICENSING 

 

Section 

172.10 Purpose 

172.20 Three Year Phase-In (Repealed) 

172.30 Definitions 

172.40 Licensure Requirements 

172.50 Licensed Contractor's Employee Certifications 

172.60 Possession of OSHA Identification Cards 

172.70 Fees 

172.80 Licensure of Out-of-State Contractors (Repealed) 

172.90 Issuance of License; Renewal; Restoration; Replacement 

172.100 Reporting 

172.110 Disciplinary Actions Related to Contractor Notice of Violations (CNOV) 

172.120 Contractor Notice of Violation Citations and Penalty Process 

172.130 Review Panel (Repealed) 

172.140 Procedures for Administrative Citations and Administrative Citation Appeals 

172.150 Status of Licensed Contractor During Appeal of Administrative Citation 

172.160 Hearing Procedures for Formal Charges 

 

172.APPENDIX A Contractor Violations (Repealed) 

 

AUTHORITY:  Implementing the Petroleum Equipment Contractors Licensing Act [225 ILCS 

729] and authorized by Sections 25 and 73 of the Petroleum Equipment Contractors Licensing 

Act [225 ILCS 729/25 and 73]. 

 

SOURCE:  Adopted at 27 Ill. Reg. 15346, effective September 16, 2003; amended at 47 Ill. Reg. 

6755, effective May 2, 2023; amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12822, effective August 7, 2024. 

 

Section 172.40  Licensure Requirements 

 

a) No person shall engage in any UST activity without first applying for and 

obtaining a license from the OSFM.  All contractors performing UST activity in 

Illinois must hold the license required under PECLA and this Part for each 

module in which work is performed and shall be required to meet the standards 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12825 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

for that work module established by 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172, 174, 175, 176 and 

177 and the requirements of 29 CFR 1910.120.  Licensure is for a 2-year period.  

Applicants for a license to become a contractor must comply with the Petroleum 

Equipment Contractors Licensing Act [225 ILCS 729] as evidenced by the 

licensure submissions required by this Section. 

 

b) An application for a new contractor license shall be made on-line at the UST 

Applications and Forms page for OSFM's Division of Petroleum and Chemical 

Safety (DPCS) at the following link: 

https://webapps.sfm.illinois.gov/USTPortal/Contractor/Application. Renewal of 

licenses shall be applied for at the UST Portal after the licensee logs in to their 

secure account at the UST Applications and Forms page for DPCS at 

https://webapps.sfm.illinois.gov/USTPortal/Home/Login?ReturnUrl=%2fUSTPor

tal.  The licensure application shall include the following submissions: 

 

1) If seeking a license as a contractor: 

 

A) the State license application and licensing fee required by Section 

172.70; 

 

B) the names of all of the contractor's certified employees, on the 

OSFM prescribed form, stating any UST module in which the 

employee is certified. Contractors are required to be certified if a 

sole proprietor, or have a certified employee, for each UST module 

for which they are applying to be licensed; 

 

C) an original annual certificate of general liability insurance in a 

minimum of $1,000,000 for each occurrence, with the OSFM as 

certified holder; 

 

D) evidence of a passing score on the required OSFM approved exam 

for the module for which licensure is being sought. The evidence 

must be an original certification that includes a photo of the 

individual taking the exam, supplied by the exam provider, or other 

copy of the certification as approved by OSFM; 

 

E) proof of successful completion of initial 40-hour OSHA training 

and subsequent 8-hour refresher course; and 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12826 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

F) evidence of current registration and proof of status of good 

standing with the Illinois Secretary of State, as applicable for the 

form of business entity applying for licensure, or if a sole 

proprietor, evidence of compliance with the Assumed Business 

Name Act [805 ILCS 405]. 

 

2) If seeking a license as a tank or line precision tester, in lieu of a passing 

score on the required OSFM approved exam for the tank or line precision 

testing module, the certified employee may designate the testing methods 

for which a license is sought and provide proof that he/she, or any certified 

employee conducting testing, is certified by the manufacturer of the 

testing equipment. Such proof shall be submitted at the time of license 

application and shall reflect certification for the license period and the 

equipment being used, or that the applicant has passed an OSFM approved 

exam.; and 

 

3) If seeking a license in the module that authorizes lining or internal 

inspections of tank linings, the applicant additionally shall provide proof 

that the applicant has designated at least one certified employee 

conducting lining activity, that is approved by the manufacturer of the 

lining material as qualified and trained in the application of the material 

and has adequate equipment to perform the interior lining safely. The 

applicant must also possess licensure in the decommissioning module. The 

certified employees designated by the applicant shall possess the 

qualifications required for both the lining and the decommissioning 

modules.  Such proof shall be submitted at the time of license application 

and reflect certification for the license period and the equipment being 

used. 

 

4) If seeking a license in the module that authorizes inspection and testing of 

UST equipment, the applicant shall designate the testing methods for 

which a license is sought and provide proof that the certified employee has 

passed the required OSFM-approved exam for the installation/retrofitting 

module or has the credentials and training as required by the 

manufacturer's recommended procedures and instructionsis certified by 

the manufacturer of the equipment being inspected or tested. The 

employing licensed contractor may certify the employee has the requisite 

credentials and training.  Such proof shall be submitted at the time of 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12827 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

license application and shall reflect certification for the license period and 

the equipment being inspected or tested. 

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12822, effective August 7, 2024) 

 

Section 172.50  Licensed Contractor's Employee Certifications 

 

a) A certified employee is an individual who performs a UST activity for a licensed 

contractor and has successfully completed OSFM prescribed exams for the 

module in which the employee is conducting the UST activity, or meets other 

requirements under Section 172.40(b). 

 

b) A contractor shall have at least one employee certified for the permitted UST 

activity, unless the contractor itself is an individual contractor who is so certified. 

 

c) A contractor shall have at least one employee certified in the UST activity for 

which the permit was issued actively supervising the UST activity being 

performed on the job site, unless the contractor itself is an individual who is so 

certified and supervises the work. At all times during UST operations, there shall 

be a certified employee or certified individual contractor on the job site; 

subcontractors are not employees. 

 

d) Certified employees of licensed contractors shall possess a wallet card or proof of 

certification verifying successful passage of OSFM approved exams, or for 

precision testing or inspection and testing of other UST equipment, proof of 

certification by the manufacturer.  The wallet card or proof of certification must 

be carried by the certified employee on UST job sites at all times and shall be 

available upon request by any OSFM representative. 

 

e) Licensed contractors and any of their employees performing a UST activity shall 

possess OSHA Identification Cards or proof of certification, described in Section 

172.60, on UST job sites at all times that shall be made available upon request by 

any OSFM representative. 

 

f) Licensed contractors in all UST activity modules are required to follow the 

scheduling requirements for date certain and/or time certain schedules established 

by DPCS.  For all permitted inspections, scheduling with OSFM shall be done in 

advance by the contractor on-line via the UST contractor portal, located at the 

UST Applications and Forms page for the DPCS at 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12828 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

https://webapps.sfm.illinois.gov/USTPortal/Home/Login?ReturnUrl=%2FUSTPor

tal.  Submission of any completed testing forms required by OSFM rule shall also 

be submitted on-line at the UST portal. 

 

g) UST activities may be shut down by any OSFM DPCS manager, supervisor, or 

Storage Tank Safety Specialist (STSS) if individual contractors or their 

employees are not in compliance with subsections (a) through (f) of this Section. 

Such work shall not resume until approval is granted by the OSFM. 

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12822, effective August 7, 2024) 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12829 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENT 

 

 

1) Heading of the Part:  General Requirements for Underground Storage Tanks and the 

Storage, Transportation, Sale and Use of Petroleum and Other Regulated Substances 

 

2) Code Citation:  41 Ill. Adm. Code 174 

 

3) Section Number:   Adopted Action: 

174.210   Amendment 

 

4) Statutory Authority:  Implementing the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15] and 

authorized by Section 2 of the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15/2]. 

 

5) Effective Date of Rule:  August 7, 2024   

 

6) Does this rulemaking contain an automatic repeal date?  No 

 

7) Does this rulemaking contain incorporations by reference?  Yes 

 

8) A copy of the Adopted Rule, including any matter incorporated by reference, are on file 

in the principal office of the State Fire Marshal, 1035 Stevenson Drive, Springfield, 

Illinois, and are available for public inspection at that location. 

 

9) Notice of Proposal published in the Illinois Register:  48 Ill. Reg. 3654; March 15, 2024 

 

10) Has JCAR issued a Statement of Objection to this rulemaking?  No 

 

11) Differences between Proposal and Final Version:  OSFM became aware of a typo in one 

of the code titles being updated.  As a result, in Section 174.210 (a), "PEI/RP 100-20" 

was changed to "PEI/RP 100-22".  No other JCAR agreed changes were found to be 

necessary by JCAR.  

 

12) Have all the changes agreed upon by the agency and JCAR been made as indicated in the 

agreement issued by JCAR?  Yes 

 

13) Will this rulemaking replace an emergency rule currently in effect?  No 

 

14) Are there any rulemakings pending to this Part?  No 

 

15) Summary and purpose of rulemaking:  Updates existing underground storage tank system 

(UST) rules concerning incorporations by reference.  Makes non-substantive changes.  



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12830 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENT 

 

 

 

16) Information and questions regarding this rulemaking shall be directed to:   

 

Tom Andryk 

Division of Legal Counsel 

Office of the State Fire Marshal 

1035 Stevenson Dr. 

Springfield, IL  62703-4259 

 

217-785-5758 

Facsimile:  217-524-5487 

SFM.USTrulemaking@fdmail.sfm.illinois.gov 

 

The full text of the Adopted Amendment begins on the next page: 

  



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12831 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENT 

 

 

TITLE 41:  FIRE PROTECTION 

CHAPTER I:  OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

PART 174 

GENERAL REQUIREMENTS FOR UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANKS  

AND THE STORAGE, TRANSPORTATION, SALE AND USE OF  

PETROLEUM AND OTHER REGULATED SUBSTANCES 

 

SUBPART A:  DEFINITIONS 

 

Section  

174.100 Definitions  

 

SUBPART B:  INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE 

 

Section  

174.200 Incorporation of National Standards  

174.210 Incorporations by Reference 

 

SUBPART C:  BULK LOADING AND UNLOADING AND  

GENERAL UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANK FACILITY REQUIREMENTS 

 

Section  

174.300 Storage, Handling and Use of Flammable and Combustible Liquids  

174.310 Bulk Loading and Unloading for Railroad Tank Cars and Tank Vehicles  

174.320 Locating Bulk Facilities Adjacent to a Motor Fuel Dispensing Facility; Dual 

Purpose USTs  

174.330 Heating Systems  

174.340 Greasing Pits 

174.350 Fire Extinguishers  

174.360 Fireworks (Repealed) 

174.370 General Requirement to Maintain All Equipment 

 

SUBPART D:  PORTABLE AND VEHICULAR DISPENSING 

 

Section  

174.400 Dispensing Requirements at Motor Fuel Dispensing Facilities  

174.410 Portable Containers and Portable Fuel Tanks 

174.420 Deliveries from Portable Fuel Tanks and Tank Vehicles Restricted  



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12832 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENT 

 

 

174.430 Auxiliary Fuel Tanks for Vehicles over a Certain Size 

174.440 Dispensing or Delivery of Flammable or Combustible Motor Fuels from Tank 

Vehicles 

174.450 Requirements for Permit to Fuel Motor Vehicles from Tank Vehicles 

 

174.APPENDIX A Derivation Table (Repealed) 

 

AUTHORITY:  Implementing the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15] and authorized by 

Section 2 of the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15/2].  

 

SOURCE:  Adopted at 34 Ill. Reg. 13318, effective September 2, 2010; amended at 42 Ill. Reg. 

10435, effective October 13, 2018; amended at 47 Ill. Reg. 6801, effective May 2, 2023; 

amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12829, effective August 7, 2024. 

 

SUBPART B:  INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE 

 

Section 174.210  Incorporations by Reference 

 

If a UST was installed prior to adoption of these standards, the standard that shall apply to any 

maintenance or repair shall be the standard cited in this Section unless otherwise specified in 41 

Ill. Adm. Code 172, 174, 175, 176 and 177. If a UST or a component of the system is installed, 

replaced or upgraded, the installation, replacement or upgrade shall comply with the standards 

listed in this Section.  

 

a) The following publications are incorporated by reference and apply to 41 Ill. 

Adm. Code 172, 174, 175, 176, and 177:  

 

Airlines for America (formerly, Air Transport Association (ATA)), 1275 

Pennsylvania Avenue, NW, Suite 1300, Washington DC  20004. Website for 

listing of publications: https://publications.airlines.org.: 

 

"Airport Fuel Facility Operations and Maintenance Guidance Manual" 

(2004 Edition). 

 

American Petroleum Institute (API). Available from the American Petroleum 

Institute, 200 Massachusetts Avenue NW, Suite 1100, Washington, DC  20001-

5571, (202) 682-8000: 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12833 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENT 

 

 

API Recommended Practice 1604, "Closure of Underground Petroleum 

Storage Tanks", Fourth Edition, 2021. 

 

API Recommended Practice 1631, "Interior Lining and Periodic 

Inspection of Underground Storage Tanks", Fifth Edition, 2001 

(Reaffirmed 2020). 

 

API Standard 2015, "Requirements for Safe Entry and Cleaning of 

Petroleum Storage Tanks", Eighth Edition, 2018. 

 

API Recommended Practice 1626, "Storing and Handling Ethanol and 

Gasoline-Ethanol Blends at Distribution Terminals and Filling Stations", 

Second Edition, 2010 (Reaffirmed 2020). 

 

American Society for Testing and Materials (ASTM). Available from the 

American Society for Testing and Materials, 100 Barr Harbor Drive, West 

Conshohocken PA  19428-2959, (610) 832-9500: 

 

ASTM F852/F852M-22 Standard Specification for Portable Gasoline, 

Kerosene, and Diesel Containers for Consumer Use (2022) 

 

The ICC International Building Code. Available from ICC, 4051 W. Flossmoor 

Rd., Country Club Hills IL  60478, (708) 799-2300: 

 

ICC International Building Code (20242021). 

 

Institute of International Banking Law & Practice, Inc. (Institute). Website: 

https://iiblp.org/pages/isp-forms https://iiblp.org/isp-forms: 

 

"International Standby Practices (ISP) 98 Form 11.1, Model Government 

Standby Form" (2014). 

 

NACE International. Available from NACE International, 15835 Park Ten Place. 

Houston, Texas  77084, (281) 228-6200: 

 

NACE Standard Practice SP0169, "Control of External Corrosion on 

Underground or Submerged Metallic Piping Systems" (2013 Edition). 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12834 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENT 

 

 

NACE Standard Practice SP0285, "External Corrosion Control of 

Underground Storage Tank Systems by Cathodic Protection" (2021 

Edition). 

 

National Fire Protection Association (NFPA). Available from the National Fire 

Protection Association, 1 Batterymarch Park, Quincy MA  02169, (617) 770-3000 

or (800) 344-3555: 

 

NFPA 10, "Standard for Portable Fire Extinguishers" (2022). 

 

NFPA 13, "Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems" (2022). 

 

NFPA 17, "Standard for Dry Chemical Extinguishing Systems" 

(20242021). 

 

NFPA 30, "Flammable and Combustible Liquids Code" (20242021). Also 

available from ANSI. 

 

NFPA 30A, "Code for Motor Fuel Dispensing Facilities and Repair 

Garages" (20242021). Also available from ANSI. 

 

NFPA 58, "Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code" (20242020).  

 

NFPA 70, "National Electrical Code" (20232020). Also available from 

ANSI. 

 

NFPA 72, "National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code" (2022).   

 

NFPA 101, "Life Safety Code" (2015). Also available from ANSI. 

 

NFPA 385, "Standard for Tank Vehicles for Flammable and Combustible 

Liquids" (2022). Also available from ANSI. 

 

NFPA 407, "Standard for Aircraft Fuel Servicing" (2022). 

 

National Leak Prevention Association (NLPA). Available from the National Leak 

Prevention Association, 75-4 Main Street, Suite 300, Plymouth NH  03264, e-

mail:  info@NLPA-online.org, website:  https://www.nlpa-online.org/, (815) 301-

2785 (phone):  



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12835 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENT 

 

 

 

NLPA Standard 631 (Chapters A & B Only), "Entry, Cleaning, Interior 

Inspection, Repair and Lining of Underground Storage Tanks" (Chapter 

A) and "Future Internal Inspection Requirements for Lined Tanks" 

(Chapter B), 2016 Revision. 

 

National Work Group on Leak Detector Evaluations (NWGLDE), List of Leak 

Detection Evaluations for Storage Tank Systems, Twenty-Fourth Edition (January 

3, 2017), as subsequently modified by the ThirtiethTwenty-Ninth Edition 

(January 1831, 20232022), available at: www.neiwpcc.org/nwglde 

www.nwglde.org. 

 

Petroleum Equipment Institute (PEI). Available from the Petroleum Equipment 

Institute, P.O. Box 2380, Tulsa OK  74101-2380, RP@pei.org, (918) 494-9696 

(phone), (918) 491-9895 (fax): 

 

PEI/RP 100-220, "Recommended Practices for Installation of 

Underground Liquid Storage Systems" (20222020). 

 

PEI/RP 500-19, "Recommended Practices for Inspection and Maintenance 

of Motor Fuel Dispensing Equipment" (2019). 

 

PEI/RP 900-21, "Recommended Practices for the Inspection and 

Maintenance of UST Systems" (2021). 

 

PEI/RP 1000-22, "Recommended Practices for the Installation of Marina 

Fueling Systems" (2022). 

 

PEI/RP 1200-19, "Recommended Practices for the Testing and 

Verification of Spill, Overfill, Leak Detection and Secondary Containment 

Equipment at UST Facilities" (2019). 

 

PEI/RP 1300-20, "Recommended Practices for the Design, Installation, 

Service, Repair and Maintenance of Aviation Fueling Systems" (2020). 

 

PEI/RP 1400-21, "Recommended Practices for the Design and Installation 

of Fueling Systems for Emergency Generators, Stationary Diesel Engines 

and Oil Burner Systems" (2021). 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12836 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENT 

 

 

Steel Tank Institute (STI). Available from the Steel Tank Institute, 944 Donata 

Court, Lake Zurich IL  60047, (847) 438-8265: 

 

STI (F894) (ACT 100), "Specification for External Corrosion Protection 

of FRP Composite Steel Underground Storage Tanks", revised July 

2019May 2018. 

 

Underwriters Laboratories, c/o COMM 2000, 151 Eastern Avenue, Bensenville IL  

60106, 1-888-853-3503: 

 

"Standard for Pre-Engineered and Engineered Dry and Pre-Engineered 

Wet Chemical Extinguishing System Units", UL 1254, Sixth Edition 

(2019), with revisions through February 9, 2022. 

 

"Standard for Fibre Reinforced Underground Tanks for Flammable and 

Combustible Liquids", UL 1316, Third Edition (2018), with revisions 

through March 12, 2019.  

 

"Standard for Aboveground Piping for Flammable and Combustible 

Liquids", UL 1369, First Edition (20182020), with revisions through 

August 25, 2020. 

 

US Department of Defense (available at http://www.wbdg.org/ffc/dod): 

 

"Unified Facilities Criteria (UFC) 3-460-01, Design:  Petroleum Fuel 

Facilities", 2019 Edition as revised by Change 32, eff. June 8, 

2023January 12, 2022. 

 

Department of Defense Manual 4140.25, Volume 9, "DoD Management 

of Energy Commodities:  Defense Fuel Support Point (DFSP) Bulk 

Petroleum Inventory Accounting" (eff. April 4, 2019) (previously 

consolidated from Department of Defense Instruction Number 4140.25, 

"DoD Management of Bulk Petroleum Products, Natural Gas, and Coal", 

Volume II:  "Petroleum Management", Chapter 10:  "Accountability", eff. 

June 22, 1994). 

 

b) The following federal regulations (Code of Federal Regulations (CFR)) are 

incorporated by reference and apply to 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172, 174, 175, 176 and 

177. Available from the Superintendent of Documents, U.S. Government Printing 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12837 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENT 

 

 

Office, Washington DC  20401, website for electronic text:  

https://ecfr.federalregister.gov, (202) 512-1800: 

 

29 CFR 1910.120 (May 14, 2019). 

 

29 CFR 1910.146 (December 27, 2011). 

 

29 CFR 1926 (September 15, 2020). 

 

40 CFR 280 (October 13, 2015). 

 

40 CFR 302.1 through 302.6 and 355.40 (July 24, 2020).  

 

c) If the above-referenced publications conflict with specific provisions of 41 Ill. 

Adm. Code 172, 174, 175, 176 or 177, the Illinois rules shall take precedence 

over the publications identified in subsection (a) and the federal rules (identified 

in subsection (b)) shall take precedence over the Illinois rules. However, the 

provisions of 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172, 174, 175, 176, and 177 shall not be deemed 

to be in conflict with federal rules on the basis that the Illinois rules are more 

specific than, more stringent than, or impose requirements for which no similar 

requirements are contained in, laws and rules enforced by agencies of the federal 

government. 

 

d) The following Illinois regulations are referenced in 41 Ill. Adm. Code 176:   

 

Pollution Control Board:  35 Ill. Adm. Code 734 (March 19, 2012) 

 

Department of Transportation:  92 Ill. Adm. Code 172 (January 24, 2018) 

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12829, effective August 7, 2024) 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12838 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

1) Heading of the Part:  Technical Requirements for Underground Storage Tanks and the 

Storage, Transportation, Sale and Use of Petroleum and Other Regulated Substances 

 

2) Code Citation:  41 Ill. Adm. Code 175 

 

3) Section Numbers:   Adopted Actions: 

175.200   Amendment 

175.300   Amendment 

175.320   Amendment 

175.810   Amendment 

175.830   Amendment 

175.840   Amendment 

175.Appendix A  Amendment 

175.Appendix B  Amendment 

 

4) Statutory Authority:  Implementing the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15] and 

authorized by Section 2 of the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15/2]. 

 

5) Effective Date of Rule:  August 7, 2024   

 

6) Does this rulemaking contain an automatic repeal date?  No 

 

7) Does this rulemaking contain incorporations by reference?  Yes  

 

8) A copy of the Adopted Rules, including any matter incorporated by reference, are on file 

in the principal office of the State Fire Marshal, 1035 Stevenson Drive, Springfield, 

Illinois, and are available for public inspection at that location. 

 

9) Notice of Proposal Published in the Illinois Register:  48 Ill. Reg. 3665; March 15, 2024 

 

10) Has JCAR issued a Statement of Objection to this rulemaking?  No 

 

11) Differences between Proposal and Final Version:  The JCAR agreed changes were as 

follows: 

 

--in subsection 175.200(c), in the 6th sentence, changed "the right to dispense" to "the 

ability to dispense"; 

 

--in subsection 175.200(d)(3), changed "and/or" to "or"; 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12839 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

 

--in subsection 175.200(d)(4)(D), in the second sentence, changed "requirement" to 

"requirements"; 

 

--in subsection 175.200(e)(4), in the second sentence, changed "Notification" to 

"notification"; 

 

--in subsection 175.300(k)(2), in the second sentence, changed "required to be 

conducted" to "required"; 

 

--in subsection 175.830(a)(3), in the second sentence, after "at a site, " inserted "and for 

every tank removal,"; 

 

--in subsection 175.830(a)(9), in the first sentence, changed "insure" to "ensure"; 

 

--in subsection 175.830(a)(19), in the first sentence, changed "has observed" to 

"observes"; 

 

--in subsection 175.830(a)(19), at the end of the first sentence, changed "the Illinois 

Emergency Management Agency" to "the Illinois Emergency Management Agency-

Office of Homeland Security (IEMA-OHS)"; 

 

--in subsection 175.830(a)(19), in the second sentence, changed "his/her" to "the STSS"; 

 

--in subsection 175.830(b)(7)(C), changed "IEMA" to "IEMA-OHS"; 

 

--in subsection 175.840(d)(9), in the first sentence, changed "insure" to "ensure"; 

 

--in subsection 175.840(f), at the end of that paragraph, added "Compliance with 

subsections (d)(15) through (d)(16) is the responsibility of the owner.". 

 

12) Have all the changes agreed upon by the agency and JCAR been made as indicated in the 

agreement issued by JCAR?  Yes 

 

13) Will this rulemaking replace an emergency rule currently in effect?  No 

 

14) Are there any rulemakings pending to this Part?  No 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12840 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

15) Summary and purpose of rulemaking:  This rulemaking will update the Illinois technical 

requirements for underground storage tank systems ("USTs").  This proposed rulemaking 

provides that whenever a removal permit is issued, a site assessment pursuant to 41 Ill. 

Adm. Code 176.330 is required to be conducted as part of the removal work, including 

whenever there is to be a removal of over 20 feet or 50% of a piping line.  Clarifies that 

removal of over 20 feet or 50% of a product piping line is an OSI inspection that requires 

an OSFM inspection before the work can be concluded.  Provides that installation of a 

spill containment device with or without a riser replacement falls into that category of 

UST permitted work that must be scheduled but does not require a representative of the 

contractor present at the site at the scheduled inspection time.  Defines "back in service" 

for purposes of the out of service requirements found at 41 Ill. Adm. Code 175.810.  

Clarifies that pursuant to 41 Ill. Adm. Code 176.245, financial responsibility must be 

maintained on an out-of-service UST until such time as the UST is removed or 

abandoned in place.  Organizes and makes non-substantive changes to language 

concerning the delegation of authority to enforce UST rules and regulations to any 

municipality having a population over 500,000, pursuant to the Gasoline Storage Act 

[430 ILCS 15/2], moving the language out of Part 175 and consolidating that language in 

amendments being concurrently made to 41 Ill. Adm. Code 176.400.  Provides that the 

motor fuel dispensing permit shall be issued via the green decal (instead of issued 

separately) and shall expire at the same time as the decal on December 31 of the year 

shown on the decal.  Makes grammatical and other non-substantive changes. 

 

16) Information and questions regarding this rulemaking shall be directed to:   

 

Tom Andryk 

Division of Legal Counsel 

Office of the State Fire Marshal 

1035 Stevenson Dr. 

Springfield, IL  62703-4259 

 

217-785-5758 

Facsimile:  217-524-5487 

SFM.USTrulemaking@fdmail.sfm.illinois.gov 

 

The full text of the Adopted Amendments begins on the next page: 

  



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12841 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

TITLE 41:  FIRE PROTECTION 

CHAPTER I:  OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

PART 175 

TECHNICAL REQUIREMENTS FOR UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANKS AND THE 

STORAGE, TRANSPORTATION, SALE AND USE OF PETROLEUM 

AND OTHER REGULATED SUBSTANCES 

 

SUBPART A:  DEFINITIONS 

 

Section  

175.100 Definitions  

 

SUBPART B:  MOTOR FUEL DISPENSING FACILITY REQUIREMENTS 

 

Section  

175.200 General Requirements for Motor Fuel Dispensing Facilities  

175.210 Attended Self-Service Motor Fuel Dispensing Facilities and Islands 

175.220 Unattended Self-Service Motor Fuel Dispensing Facilities and Islands 

175.230 Fleet Vehicle Motor Fuel Dispensing Facilities 

175.240 Full Service Motor Fuel Dispensing Facilities and Islands 

175.250 Marine Motor Fuel Dispensing Facilities 

175.260 Miscellaneous General Operating Requirements  

 

SUBPART C:  PERMITS, FEES AND SCHEDULING 

 

Section  

175.300 Permitted UST Activity  

175.310 Site Plans  

175.320 Scheduling of UST Activity  

175.330 Payment of 1988 Annual UST Fee (Repealed) 

 

SUBPART D:  DESIGN, INSTALLATION AND CONSTRUCTION REQUIREMENTS 

 

Section  

175.400 Design and Construction of USTs   

175.405 Spill Containment and Overfill Prevention Equipment  

175.410 Submersible, Under-dispenser, Transition and Other Containment Sumps 

175.415 UST Compatibility with Product Stored  



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12842 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

175.420 Piping 

175.425 UST Wiring Procedures  

175.430 Clearance Required for USTs 

175.435 Testing of Tanks or Lines 

175.440 Venting of Tanks 

175.445 Fill Pipes 

175.450 Pumps, Dispensers and Other Product Transfer Equipment 

175.455 USTs Inside or Under Buildings 

175.460 Marinas 

175.465 Additional Requirements for Installation and Upgrade of USTs 

 

SUBPART E:  CORROSION PROTECTION 

 

Section  

175.500 Interior Lining and Lining Inspection of USTs  

175.510 Corrosion Protection  

 

SUBPART F:  RELEASE DETECTION 

 

Section  

175.600 Owner/Operator Spill and Overfill Release Control Responsibilities  

175.610 General Release Detection Requirements for All USTs  

175.620 Release Detection Requirements for Hazardous Substance USTs  

175.630 Methods of and Requirements for Release Detection for Tanks  

175.640 Methods of and Requirements for Release Detection for Piping  

175.650 Release Detection and Cathodic Protection Recordkeeping  

 

SUBPART G:  REPAIRS TO UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANKS  

AND DEFECTIVE EQUIPMENT 

 

Section  

175.700 Repairs Allowed  

175.710 Emergency Repairs  

175.720 Defective or Non-Compliant Equipment and Emergency Action by OSFM  

 

SUBPART H:  REMOVAL, ABANDONMENT AND CHANGE-IN-SERVICE 

 

Section  

175.800 Removal, Abandonment-in-Place or Change-in-Service Records  



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12843 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

175.810 Out of Service  

175.820 Change-in-Service of USTs  

175.830 Removal of USTs  

175.840 Abandonment-in-Place  

 

SUBPART I:  UST SYSTEMS WITH FIELD-CONSTRUCTED TANKS AND  

AIRPORT HYDRANT FUEL DISTRIBUTION SYSTEMS 

 

Section 

175.900  General Requirements 

175.910 Additions, Exceptions, and Alternatives for UST Systems with Field-Constructed 

Tanks and Airport Hydrant Systems 

175.920 Partial Exclusions for Aboveground Storage Tanks Associated with Airport 

Hydrant Systems and Field-Constructed Tanks 

 

175.APPENDIX A UST Activity that Cannot Proceed Without an OSFM Inspector on Site 

175.APPENDIX B The Type of OSFM Permit Required for Specific Permitted UST 

Activities 

175.APPENDIX C Derivation Table (Repealed) 

 

AUTHORITY:  Implementing the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15] and authorized by 

Section 2 of the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15/2].  

 

SOURCE:  Adopted at 34 Ill. Reg. 13358, effective September 2, 2010; emergency amendment 

at 37 Ill. Reg. 5195, effective April 4, 2013, for a maximum of 150 days; amended at 37 Ill. Reg. 

13443, effective August 1, 2013; amended at 42 Ill. Reg. 10476, effective October 13, 2018; 

amended at 47 Ill. Reg. 6837, effective May 2, 2023; amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12838, effective 

August 7, 2024. 

 

SUBPART B:  MOTOR FUEL DISPENSING FACILITY REQUIREMENTS 

 

Section 175.200  General Requirements for Motor Fuel Dispensing Facilities 

 

a) Other than kerosene and except as otherwise provided in this Subpart B and 41 Ill. 

Adm. Code 180, all dispensing of flammable and combustible liquids at motor 

fuel dispensing facilities shall be from underground storage tanks. 

 

b) All motor fuel dispensing facilities must abide by the operating and other 

requirements of this Subpart B.  



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12844 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

 

c) Motor fuel dispensing facilities must hold a current and valid motor fuel 

dispensing permit, as evidenced by the affixing of a current green decal from the 

OSFM in accordance with 41 Ill. Adm. Code 177.115, for the particular type of 

facility involved in order to operate.  No motor fuel dispensing facility shall open 

for business until inspected and approved by OSFM. Facilities operating under 

different classifications at any time shall submit a motor fuel dispensing facility 

application and obtain approvaldispensing permits for and meet the requirements 

for the classification with the most stringent requirements that applyall respective 

classifications that apply to the facility. Approval for dispensing operations via 

the green decal will be granted upon compliance with 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172, 174, 

175, 176 and 177.  No owner or other person or responsible entity shall permit 

any person to violate the provisions of this Subpart B. Violation of the 

requirements for motor fuel dispensing facilities of this Subpart B may subject the 

owner or operator to penalties that may include revocation of the ability to 

dispensefacility motor fuel dispensing permit issued under this Subpart and the 

green decal issued under 41 Ill. Adm. Code 177 as required for operation of the 

facility.  Failure to remain in compliance with UST rules may also result in 

OSFM's issuance of a red tag for the tanks at issue, prohibiting any further 

operation of the facility or further deposit of regulated substances into any tank 

subject to a red tag. Maintenance of equipment physically connected to the UST, 

including dispensers, hoses, emergency breakaways, electrical equipment directly 

tied to the UST, emergency stops and shear valves, are required items subject to 

red tag for noncompliance. 

 

d) Applications for a Motor Fuel Dispensing Facility Permit 

 

1) No construction of a motor fuel dispensing facility or modification of an 

existing motor fuel dispensing facility shall be commenced until 

applications and plans are given written approval in the form of a review 

letter by OSFM. 

 

2) Only contractors currently licensed and certified in accordance with 41 Ill. 

Adm. Code 172 may submit motor fuel dispensing facility permit 

applications.  A UST contractor portal for the on-line submission of the 

motor fuel dispensing permit application can be found at the UST 

Applications and Forms page for the DPCS at 

https://webapps.sfm.illinois.gov/USTPortal/Home/Login?ReturnUrl=%2f

USTPortal.  The applications shall be those prescribed by OSFM and 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12845 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

plans must be submitted for each motor fuel dispensing facility showing 

compliance with applicable OSFM rules. The plans shall be drawn to scale 

and shall, at a minimum, include the following:  

 

A) Lot lines and dimensions.  

 

B) Building lines and dimensions.  

 

C) Location and size of tanks and dispensing devices or equipment.  

 

D) Location of control station (if applicable).  

 

E) Locations of all emergency stops.  

 

3) After examining the submitted application and plans, OSFM shall issue a 

review letter valid for a period of 6 months. Submission of incomplete or 

illegible applications and/or plans shall be cause for denial of applications. 

 

4) Motor fuel dispensing facility work of the following kinds requires 

application and plan submittal to OSFM prior to commencing the work:  

 

A) A station being newly constructed. 

 

B) A station being established in a building that previously contained 

a different occupancy. 

 

C) Making substantial modifications to an existing facility. 

Substantial modification would include, but not be limited to: 

 

i) Installation of new dispensing islands or dispensers in new 

locations. 

 

ii) Relocation of an emergency stop. 

 

D) Changing from one facility classificationcategory to another, as 

those classificationscategories are listed in Sections 175.210 

through 175.250.  The requirementsrequirement to submit a motor 

fuel dispensing facility application and comply with the most 

stringent set of dispensing requirementsobtain a permit for the 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12846 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

change will still apply even if only part of the facility is being 

changed, (for example only one dispenser island) or if the facility 

plans to operate under a different classificationcategory for only a 

portion of a 24-hour period.  

 

E) Construction or relocation of buildings on the property, even if 

they are not the "primary" motor fuel dispensing facility station 

control buildings. 

 

5) Motor fuel dispensing facility work of the following kinds does not 

require application and plan submittal to OSFM prior to commencing the 

work. This type of work or modifications will be inspected by OSFM 

when the facility is due for permit renewal: 

 

A) Like-for-like replacement of existing equipment (e.g., replacement 

of existing dispensing cabinets or components not involving the 

shear valve or items below the shear valve; changing existing 

dispensing nozzles, hoses or fittings; replacing an existing 

emergency stop in its current location).  

 

B) Replacing (or installing additional) collision protection posts or 

guardrails. 

 

C) Changing or replacing warning or instructional signs. 

 

D) Replacing or adding to the complement of portable fire 

extinguishers. 

 

6) In addition to the requirement for a motor fuel dispensing permit pursuant 

to this Subpart before any dispensing can occur, work affecting UST 

components or equipment shall also require a separate Section 175.300 

permit to be obtained via the submittal of separate applications to OSFM 

pursuant to that Section. 

 

e) Issuance and Renewal of Motor Fuel Dispensing Facility Permits  

 

1) A motor fuel dispensing facility permit or permit renewal will be issued 

via the green decal by OSFM after an on-site inspection has been 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12847 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

conducted by OSFM to verify compliance with all applicable OSFM 

administrative rules. 

 

2) No motor fuel dispensing facility shall open for business until inspected 

and approved by OSFM, and until OSFM issues a green decalmotor fuel 

dispensing facility permit, which must be prominently displayed at all 

times at the motor fuel dispensing facility. When a facility is required to 

obtain more than one kind of permit, all the permits shall be displayed. 

 

3) Motor fuel dispensing facility permits shall be issued via the green decal 

on a biennial basis. These permits (issued via the green decal) shall expire 

on December 31 of the year shown on the decalpermit. 

 

4) Any name or ownership change shall require completion of an electronic 

Notification of Ownership Change for Underground Storage Tanks under 

41 Ill. Adm. Code 176.440(g) within 30 days, at the UST Applications and 

forms page for the DPCS at 

https://sfm.illinois.gov/about/divisions/petroleum-chemical-

safety/applications-and-forms.html. Copies of proof of legal ownership, 

including, but not limited to, the current deed, contract or lease, shall be 

downloaded with this notificationNotification. 

 

f) Storage and handling of LP gases at motor fuel dispensing facilities shall be in 

accordance with 41 Ill. Adm. Code 200. 

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12838, effective August 7, 2024) 

 

SUBPART C:  PERMITS, FEES AND SCHEDULING 

 

Section 175.300  Permitted UST Activity  

 

Any UST activity or other permitted activity under this Section must comply with the following: 

 

a) Permit Requirements 

 

1) Prior to the onset of UST activity, a completed permit application, 

including fee payment of $200 per permitted activity, shall be submitted to 

OSFM.  

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12848 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

2) A separate fee is required for each type of activity. 

 

3) This fee is to be paid by check or money order made payable to "Office of 

the State Fire Marshal", or electronic payment via the UST contractor 

portal (at 

https://webapps.sfm.illinois.gov/USTPortal/Home/Login?ReturnUrl=%2f

USTPortal) and is to be from the licensed contractor obtaining the permit. 

 

4) Only contractors currently licensed and certified in accordance with 41 Ill. 

Adm. Code 172 may obtain permits. Contractors are required to be 

OSFM licensed and have at least one employee doing the work who shall 

be certified under 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172 for the UST activity that is being 

performed.  A UST contractor portal for the on-line submission of permit 

applications and the scheduling of permitted work can be found at the 

website cited in subsection (a)(3). 

 

5) Only licensed contractors, their employees or subcontractors may perform 

the permitted UST activity in accordance with 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172. 

 

6) Permit applications denied or rejected the second time will require a new 

permit application and submission of a new fee. 

 

7) Permit applications and issued permits are not transferable. 

 

8) The owner of the UST must be identified on the permit application.  

 

9) No permit may be issued when the current owner listed on the application 

owes fees pursuant to 41 Ill. Adm. Code 176.450 or 176.455 until the fees 

are paid in full. 

 

10) No permit may be issued for UST activity unrelated to correcting existing 

violations while the violations continue to exist on that same site.  

 

b) No UST activity requiring a permit may proceed without a granted permit. 

 

c) No UST owners or operators may perform any UST activity, unless the owner 

complies with the licensing and certification requirements of 41 Ill. Adm. Code 

172. 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12849 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

d) UST activity performed that is not in compliance with the conditions of a permit 

issued to a licensed contractor, or false information supplied to obtain a permit, is 

cause for permit revocation, or suspension or revocation of the license of the 

contractor to perform any UST activity.  

 

e) For purposes of this Section, the following terms shall be considered 

interchangeable or equivalent:  "installer" and "replacer"; "install" and "replace"; 

"repairer" and "a person who upgrades"; "repair" and "upgrade"; "remover" and "a 

person who abandons-in-place"; and "remove" and "abandon-in-place".  

 

f) Actions Requiring a Permit. A permit is required to do any of the following to 

USTs: 

 

1) install new underground tanks or piping;  

 

2) remove tanks or piping; 

 

3) abandon-in-place a UST or piping; 

 

4) upgrade; 

 

5) repair, including replacing flex connectors, risers or vents. If the work 

performed on risers or vents is done as a result of water ingress or a failed 

tank precision test, a subsequent tank precision test shall be performed 

after the work is completed; 

 

6) line a double-walled tank for compatibility purposes; 

 

7) inspect linings; 

 

8) emergency repairs; 

 

9) repair, install or remove cathodic or corrosion protection, including on flex 

connectors; 

 

10) perform any hot work on a UST;  

 

11) installation, upgrade or removal of the following (except for any like-for-

like replacements listed in subsection (g)):  



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12850 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

 

A) leak detection systems (see Section 175.630(f), providing that 

existing interstitial monitoring sensors and systems cannot be 

removed);  

 

B) spill containment at the tank or remote fills; and  

 

C) overfill prevention equipment;  

 

12) dispenser activity that triggers the requirement to install under-dispenser 

containment under Section 175.410(e) and any new dispenser location;  

 

13) submersible activity that triggers the requirement to install a tank 

containment sump under Section 175.410(c);  

 

14) electronic enhancement of an automatic tank gauge (ATG) that requires 

work within the ATG control module; 

 

15) connection of a new or existing bulk load-out to a new or existing UST at 

a motor fuel dispensing facility; and 

 

16) reclassifying a regulated interstitial sensor to a non-regulated interstitial 

sensor. 

 

g) Actions Not Requiring a Permit  

 

1) No permit is required to do like-for-like replacements for the following: 

 

A) submersible pumps, if already equipped with a tank containment 

sump; 

 

B) spill containment devices (insert replacements shall be at least 3.5 

gallons capacity; newly installed spill containment devices shall be 

a minimum of 5 gallons capacity);  

 

C) drop tube valves; 

 

D) ATG probes; 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12851 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

E) mechanical line leak detectors; 

 

F) electronic line leak detectors; 

 

G) wireless electronic line leak detectors;  

 

H) rectifiers; 

 

I) interstitial monitoring sensors; or 

 

J) replacement of the bolted-on top section of a shear valve only 

(replacement of an entire shear valve requires a permit and under-

dispenser containment). 

 

2) The exceptions listed in subsection (g)(1) are the only exceptions from the 

permit requirement. If the equipment is not present or another type of 

equipment is to be used, a permit shall be required. Any pipe or flex 

connector work requires a permit.  However, merely disconnecting a 

fitting, coupling or union without replacing that fitting, coupling or union 

to accomplish the replacement of the like-for-like equipment on the list in 

subsection (g)(1) will not by itself trigger the requirement for a permit.  

Although a permit is not required for like-for-like replacements, the work 

must still be performed by a licensed contractor.  When product piping is 

broken or disconnected to perform a like-for-like replacement, the piping 

line must be precision tested as tight prior to putting the piping line back 

into service.  Replacing any of the equipment listed in subsection (g)(1) 

must be reported electronically, within 24 hours after the activity, to 

OSFM, on a Like-for-Like Replacement Report form provided by OSFM 

(available at the website cited in subsection (a)(3)), listing the make, 

model and manufacturer of the equipment as applicable, and indicating 

where the equipment is being installed. For a list of the types of OSFM 

permits required for specific permitted UST activities, see Appendix B.   

 

h) Expiration and Extension of Permits. Permits expire 6 months from the date they 

are issued. The applicant may apply for additional 6-month extensions. Permit 

extensions that circumvent newly adopted technical requirements will not be 

allowed. If a party submits evidence of non-cancelable contracts executed in 

reliance on the permit sought to be extended, or if work has commenced, a party 

will not be viewed as circumventing the technical requirement. Each extension 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12852 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

request must be submitted electronically or in writing before the permit lapses and 

must be accompanied by a $200 fee.  

 

i) Amended Permits. Granted permits may be amended twice without a new 

application fee. For all permit amendments, each change that requires a new licensed 

contractor, more than minor changes to the site plan, or another engineering 

review to determine acceptability will require submission of a new permit 

application and $200 fee. Drawings related to any amendment must be submitted 

to OSFM with the amendment.  Permit amendments that circumvent newly 

adopted technical requirements will not be allowed.  

 

j) Site plans showing setback distances shall be submitted by the licensed 

contractor listed on the permit application, to OSFM, along with any motor fuel 

dispensing permit application required by Section 175.200. Site plans are subject 

to approval by OSFM before any new construction, addition or remodeling that 

alters building size, when encroachment on required setbacks would occur; 

dispenser locations; or locations or sizes of vehicle service area or storage tanks. 

Removals, lining and upgrades that involve replacing equipment with that of identical 

manufacture and model do not require submission of site plans. 

 

k) Miscellaneous   

 

1) In the event that equipment requiring a permit is installed without a permit 

or in violation of the terms of the permit, the owner/operator shall be 

required to do the following: 

 

A) Hire an OSFM licensed contractor other than the person and 

company who did the unauthorized/non-permitted work. 

 

B) Submit the proper permit application to OSFM and obtain approval 

from OSFM. 

 

C) The work shall be uncovered as necessary to allow proper 

inspection of the UST installation or modification at issue and 

OSFM may require any changes necessary to bring the installation 

into compliance with 41 Ill. Adm. Code 160, 172, 174, 175, 176, 

177 and 180. 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12853 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

D) If a safety issue is presented by the circumstances, a work site or 

UST may also be temporarily shut down to protect public safety. 

 

2) When removed piping exceeds 20 feet or 50% of the total piping run at a 

site, both a removal and an upgrade permit are required.  Whenever a 

removal permit is issued, a site assessment pursuant to 41 Ill. Adm. Code 

176.330 is required as part of the removal work.  When there are 

indications of a leak that are not contained to the UST system, owners and 

operators shall follow the procedures and requirements of 41 Ill. Adm. 

Code 176.Subpart C.  

 

3) A valid permit does not remedy the technical compliance aspects of a 

violation until the work is completed and does not allow for any 

extensions of time for compliance.  Completion of the work and a 

satisfactory OSFM final inspection does not preclude OSFM enforcement 

action against the person who illegally installed the equipment without a 

permit. 

 

l) Permits for Marinas. Due to the unique characteristics of the site at marina 

locations, additional information will be required as specified in this subsection (l) 

and as determined to be necessary by OSFM. 

 

1) Additional statements will be required as requested by OSFM to 

substantiate ownership or consent from authorities having jurisdiction over 

the waterway. 

 

2) Site Plans and Drawings. Detailed site plans and drawings shall be 

supplied as requested by OSFM to show length, width, location and 

configuration of the dock, type of construction, dispenser location and 

dispensing area, along with profiles of the UST indicating differences in 

elevation between tanks, piping and dispensers showing all valves, 

manholes, sumps, location of leak detection equipment, anti-siphon 

devices, pressure relief valves, pipe chases, sewage lines, etc. High water, 

low water and normal pool elevations shall also be given in relation to 

tank, piping and dispensers, along with any pertinent site characteristics. 

 

m) Permits for Abandonment-in-Place 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12854 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

1) An on-site waiver request or evaluation establishing the existence of at 

least one of the eligibility criteria of Section 175.840(a) shall be submitted 

by the OSFM-licensed contractor and must include accurate site plans.  A 

complete plan or diagram of the area shall be provided and show the 

location of tanks, fill pipes, vent lines, sewers, streets, product lines, 

utilities and buildings.  The facility name and location and the number and 

size of USTs involved shall also be included in the site plans.   

 

2) A description of the specific inert material to be used shall be indicated on 

the permit application. Allowed inert material shall be limited to sand, 

gravel, clay, bentonite or inert material mixed with portland cement to 

increase flowability.  The portland cement concentration may not exceed 

50 lbs. per cubic yard of mixed material. Any other materials must be 

approved by OSFM during the permit process.  Tripolymer foam may only 

be used on compartment tanks where at least 1 compartment is not being 

abandoned-in-place and will remain in use.  If tripolymer foam is to be 

used, the permit application must include buoyancy calculations based 

upon the particular tripolymer foam to be used.  Information must also be 

included that verifies the methods and materials that will be used to 

protect against UST floatation once abandoned-in-place.  PEI/RP-100 

addresses the issue of floatation and anchorage calculations that may be of 

assistance to the submitting contractor relative to determining ballast 

needs.  

 

3) If the ability to abandon-in-place is questioned, a third-party professional 

structural engineer may be used to determine the feasibility of removal in 

order to verify that the tank is or is not eligible to be abandoned in place 

under Section 175.840(a).   

 

n) For permits applicable to mobile fueling sites and related contractors, see 41 Ill. 

Adm. Code 174.440 and 174.450.  

 

o) In the event there is a delegation of authority to any municipality having a 

population over 500,000 to enforce UST rules and regulations, pursuant to the 

Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15/2] and subject to the terms of that agreement, 

that municipality and its employees may directly conduct permitting, inspections 

and enforcement regarding UST activities within the jurisdiction of that 

municipality. Permitting, inspections and enforcement may include biennial audits 

and other inspections, the completion and issuance of inspections forms and 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12855 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

notices, issuing permits, and assessing and collecting permit fees for that 

municipality's own use which are otherwise to be assessed and collected by 

OSFM under subsections (a)(1) through (a)(10). Subject to the terms of that 

agreement, when OSFM is expressly authorized to initiate enforcement action, 

that municipality has concurrent authority pursuant to Section 2(1)(a) of the 

Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15/2(1)(a)]. In conducting permitting, 

inspections and enforcement activities, the municipality shall strictly follow the 

administrative rules of OSFM promulgated pursuant to the Gasoline Storage Act 

[430 ILCS 15] and the Petroleum Equipment Contractors Licensing Act [225 

ILCS 729]. 

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12838, effective August 7, 2024) 

 

Section 175.320  Scheduling of UST Activity  

 

a) All permitted activity shall be scheduled with OSFM.  There are 2 sets of 

procedures for scheduling permitted activity, Operational Safety Inspection (OSI) 

or Performance Assurance Inspection (PAI).  The procedures for scheduling OSI 

Activity (Date Certain) are set forth in subsection (c) and for PAI Activity (Date 

and Time Certain) are set forth in subsection (d).  A licensed contractor shall have 

at least one employee certified for the UST activity for which the permit was 

issued actively supervising in person the UST activity being performed on the 

site.  At all times during permitted activity, including at all STSS inspections, 

including any final inspection, there shall be an employee or individual contractor 

certified in the work to be done on the job site. Subcontractors are not 

"employees" for this purpose. 

 

b) No permitted and scheduled OSI or PAI activity can be performed outside the 

schedule unless changes have been approved in advance by OSFM.  Notice of 

cancellation must be received by OSFM no later than 6:00 a.m. of the scheduled 

date and the revised date of the work must be at least one complete working day 

after OSFM receipt of the revised job schedule request.  The day of receipt is not 

included in the advance notice/receipt calculation.  A new permit and fee will be 

required when there is a failure to meet any of the schedules. This includes not 

being present for inspection, not being completely ready for inspection, violation 

of any technical requirements for the permitted work, allowing permit to expire 

before completing the final inspection, or not canceling the job within the allowed 

time frame.  Failure to meet the schedules also includes a failure to complete all 

UST work and site preparation necessary for the STSS inspection, including any 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12856 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

necessary testing and related corrections, prior to the time the STSS is scheduled 

to first arrive.  Upon these events, the permit is considered void and no work may 

commence until a new permit is issued and the work scheduled pursuant to this 

Section.  

 

c) OSI (Date Certain) Activity.  OSI activity includes UST installations, installation 

or removal of over 20 feet or 50% of the total piping run or an entire pipe run, 

tank removal, abandonment-in-place, lining and lining inspection, tank entry and 

any hot work. Regarding UST installation, scheduled OSFM inspections are 

required for an air test on the tank prior to installation, tank installation, air test on 

primary lines, air test on secondary containment, hydrostatic test on containments 

prior to backfill, and final inspection. Regarding installation of an entire pipe 

run, OSFM inspections are required for both the primary and secondary air test on 

the piping and a hydrostatic test on containments prior to backfill, and final 

inspection. Any additional inspection in follow-up to tank penetration via hot work, 

including a final lining inspection and tank precision testing, shall be scheduled as 

a PAI inspection.  For a listing of OSI activities, see Appendix A to this Part.  

 

1) For OSI activity, the licensed contractor shall have a granted permit before 

scheduling with OSFM to establish a specific date and time that is not less 

than one complete working day before the anticipated date of the permitted 

activity. A UST contractor portal for the on-line submission of permit 

applications and the scheduling of permitted work can be found at the UST 

Applications and Forms page for the DPCS at 

https://webapps.sfm.illinois.gov/USTPortal/Home/Login?ReturnUrl=%2fU

STPorta. 

 

2) Only the licensed contractor or an employee of the contractor (this does 

not include subcontractors) may schedule the work with OSFM. 

 

3) For OSI activity, the work will not be allowed to be done unless an STSS 

is on site. 

 

4) At the final OSI (Date Certain) inspection on a lining, a licensed contractor 

representative is not required to be on site but scheduling of the final 

inspection is required. 

 

d) PAI (Time and Date Certain) Activity. PAI permitted activity includes upgrades 

not involving piping installation, repairs not involving hot work, or cathodic 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12857 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

protection activity. PAI activities will be scheduled for a period of at least 2 

working hours (between 8:30 a.m. and 3:30 p.m. on State business days) and 

subsequent activities that interfere with the ability to inspect will not proceed until 

the time period is over.  Tank and line precision testing and cathodic protection 

testing following permitted activity must be scheduled with OSFM pursuant to 

subsection (d)(2). For a listing of OSI activities, see Appendix A.  

 

1) Permitted PAI Activity.  The licensed contractor shall have a granted 

permit before scheduling the permitted activity with OSFM not less than 

one complete working day before the anticipated date of work. A UST 

contractor portal for the on-line submission of permit applications and the 

scheduling of permitted work can be found at the website cited in 

subsection (c)(1). The Division of Petroleum and Chemical Safety 

(DPCS) will transmit an e-mail confirmation of scheduling approval 

back to the contractor within one working day. Work shall not commence 

until the contractor receives this confirmation. Only the licensed 

contractor or an employee of the contractor (this does not include 

subcontractors) may schedule the work with OSFM. 

 

2) Non-permitted PAI Activity.  Non-permitted PAI activity includes tank and 

line precision testing and cathodic protection testing following permitted 

activity. The licensed contactor or contractor's employee shall schedule the 

activity with OSFM in advance of the anticipated work. Only the contractor 

or an employee of the contractor (this does not include subcontractors) may 

schedule the work with OSFM.  A UST contractor portal for the on-line 

scheduling of non-permitted work can be found at the website cited in 

subsection (c)(1). 

 

3) When only installing a bag, wristband or spike anode for cathodic 

protection in a containment sump, or a spill containment device with or 

without a riser replacement, or an overfill prevention device, or when an 

interstitial sensor is being reclassified from regulated to non-regulated, at 

the final PAI (Time and Date Certain) inspection, a licensed contractor 

representative is not required to be on site, but scheduling of the final 

inspection is required. 

 

4) Any time an emergency repair permit is issued, the licensed contractor 

shall electronically schedule and complete the final inspection within 10 

days after issuance of the permit. 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12858 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

 

e) UST Installation.   

 

1) For all UST installations, the final inspection shall not be scheduled 

without prior submission of: 

 

A) the completed electronic Notification for Underground Storage 

Tanks form and its accompanying Authorization to Submit 

(available at https://sfm.illinois.gov/about/divisions/petroleum-

chemical-safety/applications-and-forms.html); 

 

B) the completed OSFM on-line forms for all required testing; and 

 

C) if applicable, the completed motor fuel dispensing permit 

application.   

 

2) Other kinds of permitted work do not require submission of this 

Notification form. 

 

f) There shall be no transfer or sale of product from a UST until the UST is in 

compliance with OSFM rules and any required final inspection has been 

completed. Any request to fill a required minimal amount of fuel necessary to 

perform compliance testing must be submitted electronically by an OSFM-licensed 

contractor and approved by OSFM in advance.  A Drop Fuel Request form is 

available at the UST contractor portal at the website cited in subsection (c)(1). A 

depositor may make one deposit of a regulated substance to a newly installed or 

newly lined tank to provide ballast; that fuel shall not be sold or dispensed until the 

required decal is obtained. 

 

g) In the event there is a delegation of authority to any municipality having a 

population over 500,000 to enforce UST rules and regulations, pursuant to the 

Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15/2], subject to the terms of that agreement, that 

municipality and its employees may, under this Section, supervise the above-

referenced activities in place of OSFM and its employees, regarding UST 

activities within the jurisdiction of that municipality.  In supervising such 

permitted UST activity, the municipality shall strictly follow OSFM 

administrative rules promulgated pursuant to the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 

15] and the Petroleum Equipment Contractors Licensing Act [225 ILCS 729]. 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12859 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12838, effective August 7, 2024) 

 

SUBPART H:  REMOVAL, ABANDONMENT AND CHANGE-IN-SERVICE 

 

Section 175.810  Out of Service 

 

a) USTs may be put into an out of service status provided they meet the performance 

standards for new UST systems or the upgrading requirements specified in 41 Ill. 

Adm. Code 174, 175 and 176 and 40 CFR 280, except that spill and overfill 

prevention equipment requirements do not have to be met. The USTs may 

continue in an out of service status for a period of 5 years from the date of last use 

provided they meet the following requirements: 

 

1) The tank and product lines shall be emptied immediately upon placing the 

UST in an out of service status. The UST is empty when all materials have 

been removed using commonly employed practices so that no more than 

2.5 centimeters (one inch) of residue, or 0.3% by weight of the total 

capacity of the UST system, remain in the system.  

 

2) Pursuant to Sections 175.500 and 175.510, all corrosion protection shall 

be maintained and operational for all tanks and lines, and tested as 

required, to include flex/pipe connectors. This will include any monthly 

logs that need to be maintained. 

 

3) OSFM must receive a written request, within 30 days after the date the 

tank was last used, requesting an out of service status. The request shall be 

submitted on a Notification for Underground Storage Tanks on OSFM 

forms (available at https://sfm.illinois.gov/about/divisions/petroleum-

chemical-safety/applications-and-forms.html).  

 

4) Vent lines shall be left open and functioning. 

 

5) Financial responsibility shall be maintained until such time as the UST is 

removed or abandoned-in-place in accordance with OSFM rules (see 41 

Ill. Adm. Code 176.245). 

 

65) Within 7 days, the owner/operator shall cap and secure all product lines 

and secure all pumps, manways and ancillary equipment. 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12860 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

76) Subject to all other applicable OSFM requirements, a UST may be put 

back in operation any time during the first 12 months, without meeting the 

requirements of subsection (d), subject to the requirement that OSFM be 

notified in writing on the Notification for Underground Storage Tanks 

form at least 10 days prior to operation.  The form is available at the 

website cited in subsection (a)(3). 

 

b) Failure to maintain impressed current system corrosion protection on any tank or 

piping systems at any point during the remaining 4-year out of service period 

referenced in subsection (d) shall require the removal of the USTs. When testing 

of anodes has been delayed past the regular 3-year testing interval, any anode 

system that fails testing shall require removal of the affected tanks or piping. 

 

c) Failure to empty tanks in an out of service status shall require the owner to 

remove all contents to less than an inch before proceeding with bringing the tanks 

back into service. 

 

d) Systems that have been out of use for over one year but less than 5 years may be 

put back in service provided that the facility meets all the applicable requirements 

in Parts 172, 174, 175, 176 and 177 and the following additional requirements are 

met: 

 

1) Tanks and lines shall be precision tested and proven sufficient. 

 

2) Tank and line release detection is tested and proven operational. 

 

3) Cathodic protection is tested and proven sufficient. 

 

4) A site assessment is conducted prior to bringing the UST back into 

service.  

 

5) All tests referenced in subsections (d)(1) through (d)(3) must be performed 

not more than 90 days and not less than 30 days before placing the tank 

back in service and submitted to OSFM at least 10 days prior to reopening 

so that a certification audit can be performed. 

 

6) Prior to a tank being put back in service, all requirements for return to 

service must be met, and all testing and inspections passed, and a 

Notification for Underground Storage Tanks Form placing the tanks 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12861 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

"Currently in Use" must be submitted.  The form is available at the OSFM 

website cited in subsection (a)(3) above. 

 

e) Single-wall USTs over 30 years old that have been in an out of service status 

more than one year shall be removed rather than placed back into service. 

 

f) If a UST is not placed back into service within 5 years from the date of last use, 

the tank system shall be removed within 60 days after the conclusion of the 5-year 

period.   

 

g) USTs with double-walled tanks and piping shall not be subject to the 5-year limit 

during the period that is 30 years after the date of installation or while the tank 

manufacturer's warranty is in place, whichever is less, if all of the following 

requirements are met: 

 

1) Corrosion protection has been and continues to be maintained; 

 

2) Any UST components found to be defective are replaced in the 45 days 

prior to any return to serviceactive use; and  

 

3) All requirements for return to serviceuse under subsection (d) and this 

Section are met. 

 

h) For purposes of this Section, "back in service" means that all regulatory 

requirements for a return to service have been met, and that the facility has begun 

regular dispensing operations typical for the location and is compliant with all 

leak detection, corrosion protection, and operator training requirements.  

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12838, effective August 7, 2024) 

 

Section 175.830  Removal of USTs   

 

a) For tank and piping removals, the following requirements and procedures shall be 

followed:  

 

1) Compliance with subsections (a)(2) through (a)(18) is the responsibility of 

the licensed contractor. 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12862 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

2) Except as otherwise provided in this Section, the procedures of API 1604, 

incorporated by reference in 41 Ill. Adm. Code 174.210, shall be followed 

for vapor freeing and inerting procedures. 

 

3) Secure a removal permitproper permitting and schedule removal date with 

OSFM.  When removed piping exceeds 20 feet or 50% of the total piping 

run at a site, and for every tank removal, a removal permit is required (in 

addition to any other permit that would normally be required).  A new 

permit and fee will be required when there is a failure to meet the Date 

Certain schedule established under Section 175.320, including not 

showing for the inspection, not being completely ready for the inspection, 

allowing the permit to expire before the inspection, or not cancelling the 

job before 6:00 a.m. the morning of the scheduled activity. (See Section 

175.300 for additional permit requirements.) 

 

4) Maintain all combustible gas indicator equipment according to 

manufacturer's specifications. 

 

5) Establish an exclusion zone within which smoking is prohibited, which 

shall include all hazardous (classified) locations/areas where work related 

to removal is being conducted. The use of spark producing/non-explosion 

proof equipment is prohibited in the vapor hazard area prior to removal of 

product and sludges and attaining the lower explosive limit (LEL)/oxygen 

levels required in subsection (a)(9). 

 

6) Excavate to the top of the tank. Drain product from piping into the tank or 

into approved drums, being careful to avoid any spillage to the excavation 

area.  Safely disconnect product piping from the tank. Further excavation 

below the top of the tank is not allowed until STSS has verified that tank 

conditions meet the LEL/oxygen criteria of subsection (a)(9). 

 

7) Remove all liquids from the tank using explosion-proof pumps or hand 

pumps. When suctioning product out of tanks, plastic pipes shall not be 

allowed as a suction tube. 

 

8) Regularly monitor the tank atmosphere and the excavation area with a 

combustible gas indicator for flammable or combustible vapor 

concentration until the tank is removed from both the excavation and the 

site. Monitoring the UST shall be done at 3 levels in the tank: top, middle 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12863 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

and bottom.  A confined space entry permit shall be obtained prior to tank 

entry and Safety Data Sheets (SDS) must be on site. 

 

9) Regularly monitor the tank to ensureinsure explosive conditions do not 

exist. A maximum of 5% of the LEL, or 5% or less oxygen concentration, 

shall be attained before the tank is considered safe for removal, instead of 

10%, as required in the API 1604. Dry ice shall not be allowed as a 

method of inerting tanks as referred to in API 1604. 

 

10) Bond all devices to the tank and ground the tank to a separate ground 

when vapor freeing the tank with compressed air or using inert gases 

under pressure. When using inert gases the cylinder shall be equipped with 

a pressure gauge, so that no more than 5 psi can be discharged into the 

tank during vapor freeing procedures. To ensure and maintain proper 

grounding and bonding, the connections shall be tested by the contractor 

for continuity. This testing shall be done with equipment designed for 

continuity testing. When vapor freeing of tanks, plastic pipes shall not be 

allowed as a vent tube on eductors. 

 

11) Plug and cap all accessible tank holes. One plug should have an 1/8 inch 

vent hole. 

 

12) Excavate around the tank to prepare for removal. This shall include 

excavation along one side and one end, from top to bottom. 

 

13) A STSS shall be on site before any tanks and piping are removed. 

 

14) With STSS on site, remove tank and piping from the ground.  Equipment 

with sufficient lifting capacity shall be used to lift the tank from the 

excavation and must be rated as appropriate for the particular site and 

excavation. 

 

15) Protective Equipment and Tank Cleaning Requirements 

 

A) Cleaning procedures shall be in accordance with API 2015, 

incorporated by reference in 41 Ill. Adm. Code 174.210. Personal 

protection requirements for tank cleaning personnel shall, at a 

minimum, include the following:  

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12864 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

i) protective respiratory equipment for tank cleaning 

personnel shall be the type that provides supplied positive 

air pressure to a full-face mask throughout the breathing 

cycle during all cleaning operations, in accordance with 

API 2015; 

 

ii) level B personal protective equipment with body harness 

and tag line; 

 

iii) protective booties; 

 

iv) continual monitoring of LEL and oxygen during cleaning; 

and 

 

v) attendant/observer. 

 

B) Requirements in subsection (a)(15)(A) shall not apply in the event 

that no physical entry is made into the tank. 

 

16) Any UST removed from the excavation zone shall be properly cleaned on 

site the day of the removal and removed from the site within 24 hours. 

 

17) Tanks larger than 2,000 gallons in capacity shall have holes or openings 

no less than 3 feet x 3 feet, one on each end or side, for cleaning. Tanks 

less than 2,000 gallons capacity shall have one entire side removed from 

end to end and shall be no less than 3 feet wide. 

 

18) The use of spark producing/non-explosion proof equipment is prohibited 

in the vapor hazard area prior to attaining the LEL/oxygen levels required 

in subsection (a)(9).  

 

19) If an STSS observeshas observed evidence of a release, the owner, 

operator or designated representative of the UST owner/operator must 

notify the Illinois Emergency Management Agency-Office of Homeland 

Security (IEMA-OHS).  This is to be done at the site immediately 

following the field determination and the incident number shall be given 

to the STSS prior to the STSShis/her leaving the site.  

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12865 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

20) All removals require a site assessment pursuant to 41 Ill. Adm. Code 

176.330.  

 

21) Any tank being removed without an OSFM permit will be required to be put 

back in the excavation and vented to 12 feet above grade if it has not been 

removed from the site and covered with backfill until a permit and 

licensed contractor can remove it properly. 

 

b) Bunker Tanks 

 

1) A commercial heating oil or emergency power generator tank situated 

below grade, in a basement, on a floor, and enclosed in a masonry wall 

structure, with the tank completely or partially covered by sand, or 

otherwise not fully accessible to inspection, commonly referred to as a 

"bunker tank", meets the definition of a UST (see 41 Ill. Adm. Code 

174.100).  Removal of a bunker tank shall require the owner or operator to 

hire a licensed decommissioning contractor to secure proper permitting 

and schedule the removal pursuant to Section 175.320. 

 

2) That section of the enclosing masonry partition wall that is not part of the 

building's basement exterior wall will need to be dismantled, and all sand 

within the enclosure removed.  Both masonry rubble and sand from the 

enclosure will be hauled off as special waste under manifest by a licensed 

waste hauler (see 35 Ill. Adm. Code 808 and 809). 

 

3) The exposed tank will be emptied as much as possible of any residual 

liquids, and the area will be monitored for vapors, and ventilation 

provided as needed to maintain LELs of 5% or less.  No further work on 

the tank removal will be allowed unless the STSS is on site. 

 

4) With the STSS on site and LELs at a maximum of 5%, the tank will be 

accessed for cleaning.  Tanks larger than 2,000 gallons in capacity shall 

have holes or openings no less than 3 feet x 3 feet, one on each end or 

side, for cleaning.  Tanks less than 2,000 gallons capacity shall have one 

entire side removed from end to end and shall be no less than 3 feet wide. 

 

5) Once cleaned, the tank will be cut up on site, the pieces removed from the 

building, and all parts of the tank scrapped. 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12866 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

6) Once the enclosure wall, sand and tank have been properly removed, the 

area where the bunker tank had been will be evaluated under the direction 

of the STSS on site. 

 

A) For bunker tanks, soil sampling and a site assessment will be 

required if either of the following conditions are found: 

 

i) Evidence indicating product may have migrated from the 

bunker tank to the environment beyond the floor or walls of 

the building it was located within, such as finding free 

product in a drain; or 

 

ii) Evidence is seen of both leakage of product on the floor or 

building wall where the bunker tank was located, and the 

area of floor or wall associated with evidence of leakage of 

product from the bunker tank is deteriorated or cracked 

such that there is a possibility of the product having 

migrated beyond the enclosure confines. 

 

B) In the event that any of the conditions described in subsection 

(b)(6)(A)(i) or (ii) are found, samples will be obtained from soil 

borings from beneath the floor or from outside the wall from areas 

where contamination is most likely to be present, based on the 

evidence discovered.  Samples will be submitted for analysis, and a 

release shall be reported if indicated. 

 

C) In the event that none of the conditions described in subsection 

(b)(6)(A)(i) or (ii) are found, no samples from soil borings will be 

required, and no incident shall be reported. 

 

D) The STSS on site will clearly document STSShis/her observations 

under "Remarks" on the Log of Removal, noting whether any of 

the conditions listed in subsections (b)(6)(A)(i) and (ii) were 

present. 

 

7) In addition to submitting the OSFM Site Assessment Results Report form, 

the following supplemental documentation shall also be submitted to 

OSFM to properly close the removal of a bunker tank.  The form is 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12867 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

available at the website cited in subsection (a)(19). In the event there is 

"Contamination" being reported: 

 

A) The report from the lab, including analytical results derived from 

the soil samples showing locations of the samples taken, shall be 

attached to the OSFM Site Assessment Results Report;  

 

B) The OSFM form indicating "Contamination" shall be signed by a 

Professional Engineer or a Professional Geologist; 

 

C) The IEMA-OHS Incident Number from the release report shall be 

recorded on the OSFM form; and 

 

D) The box indicating "Bunker Tank" shall be marked on the OSFM 

form. 

 

c) Disposal of Tanks 

 

1) If a tank is to be scrapped as junk, it shall be retested for combustible or 

flammable vapors and, if necessary, rendered gas free.  

 

2) If the tank last contained leaded gasoline, an unknown petroleum product 

or a hazardous substance, it may only be scrapped or junked, recertified, 

or discarded at a special waste or hazardous waste landfill as designated 

by Illinois EPA regulations. If tanks are being re-certified, the licensed 

contractor must give written notice to OSFM on the removal permit as to 

the intent to re-certify and re-use the tanks being removed. The re-certified 

tank must be re-installed within 6 months from removal.  

 

3) Removed tanks may not be reused for any purpose other than those 

allowed by OSFM rules (proper disposal at an approved landfill, scrapped 

or junked after proper cleaning, or recertified pursuant to OSFM rules). 

 

4) Compliance with this subsection (c) is the responsibility of the licensed 

contractor. 

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12838, effective August 7, 2024) 

 

Section 175.840  Abandonment-in-Place  



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12868 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

 

a) No tank or piping may be abandoned-in-place unless the permit applicant 

demonstrates eligibility for a waiver of the removal requirement for the tank 

and/or piping. The waiver shall be granted only in the following instances: 

 

1) it would be infeasible to remove the UST due to loss of adjacent or 

subjacent support of nearby structures, such as railroad tracks, streets (as 

defined in Section 1-201 of the Illinois Vehicle Code [625 ILCS 5/1-201]), 

and other USTs; 

 

2) removal is infeasible because of inaccessibility, as determined by OSFM; 

or 

 

3) in unusual situations in which removal is infeasible due to other reasons, 

as determined by OSFM. 

 

b) In the event there is a delegation of authority to any municipality having a 

population over 500,000 to enforce UST rules and regulations, pursuant to the 

Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15/2] and subject to the terms of such agreement, 

that municipality and its employees may, for USTs located within the jurisdiction 

of that municipality, (i) directly issue abandonment-in-place permits, and assess 

and collect abandonment-in-place permit fees for its own use which would 

otherwise be assessed and collected by the OSFM under subsections 

175.300(a)(1) through (a)(10) and subsection (d) of this Section, (ii) request 

records of abandonment-in-place, and (iii) supervise the activities of subsection 

(d) of this Section; however, any criteria for abandonment-in-place shall be 

identical to those found in OSFM administrative rules at 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172, 

174, 175, 176 and 177. Tanks, inside the jurisdiction of the City of Chicago, 

which were abandoned-in-place prior to July 28, 1989 (the date of repeal of home 

rule by the City over USTs) in accordance with City laws, regulations or 

ordinances, need not be removed so long as a condition under subsection (a) 

allowing abandonment continues to exist. 

 

c) Tanks abandoned prior to October 1, 1985. Tanks, outside the jurisdiction of 

the City of Chicago, filled with inert material, as described in subsection 

(d)(13), prior to October 1, 1985, need not be removed so long as a condition 

under subsection (a) allowing abandonment exists; however, the owners shall 

provide documentation of fill material and date of fill, upon request by OSFM. 

The documentation shall be a receipt or a written statement from the licensed or 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12869 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

non-licensed contractor who did the fill, a statement from the inspector who 

inspected the tank or a written statement from anyone designated by the State Fire 

Marshal or the Director of the Division of Petroleum and Chemical Safety.  

 

d) For UST or piping abandonment-in-place, the following requirements and 

procedures shall be followed: 

 

1) An OSFM permit under Section 175.300 shall be obtained and the work 

scheduled with OSFM. 

 

2) Except as otherwise provided in this Section, the procedures of API 1604 

shall be followed for vapor freeing and inerting procedures. 

 

3) All health and safety monitoring equipment shall be maintained according to 

manufacturer's specifications. 

 

4) An exclusion zone shall be established, within which smoking is 

prohibited. The exclusion zone shall include all hazardous (classified) 

locations/areas where work related to abandonment-in-place is being 

conducted. The use of spark producing/non-explosion proof equipment is 

prohibited in the vapor hazard area prior to removal of product and 

sludges and attaining the LEL/oxygen levels required in subsection (d)(9). 

 

5) Upon excavating to the top of the tank, on-site personnel shall drain 

product into approved drums or other approved receptacles. Any 

associated piping to be abandoned-in-place shall be properly secured or 

capped. Any piping removal shall adhere to Section 175.830. Further 

excavation below the top of the tank is not allowed until STSS is present 

and has verified that tank conditions meet the LEL/oxygen criteria of 

subsection (d)(9). 

 

6) All liquids shall be removed from the tank using explosion-proof pumps 

or hand pumps. 

 

7) The tank atmosphere and the excavation area shall be regularly monitored 

with a combustible gas indicator for flammable or combustible vapor 

concentration. Monitoring the UST shall be done at 3 levels in the tank: 

top, middle and bottom.  A confined space entry permit shall be obtained 

prior to tank entry and SDS must be on site. 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12870 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

 

8) Vapor freeing shall be done in accordance with API 1604, except that dry 

ice shall not be allowed as a method of inerting tanks. When vapor freeing 

the tank with compressed air or using inert gases under pressure, all 

devices shall be bonded to the tank and the tank shall be grounded to a 

separate ground. When using inert gases, the cylinder shall be equipped 

with a pressure gauge so that no more than 5 psi can be discharged into the 

tank during vapor freeing procedures. To ensure and maintain proper 

grounding and bonding, the connections shall be tested by the licensed 

contractor for continuity. This testing shall be done with equipment 

designed for continuity testing. When vapor freeing a tank, plastic pipes 

shall not be allowed as a vent tube on eductors. 

 

9) The tank shall be regularly monitored to ensureinsure that explosive 

conditions do not exist. A maximum of 5% of the LEL, or 5% or less 

oxygen concentration, shall be attained before the tank is considered safe 

for abandonment. 

 

10) An STSS shall be on site before any tanks and piping are abandoned in 

place or before any hot work can proceed. 

 

11) A sufficient number of holes or openings shall be made in the tank for 

abandonment-in-place procedures if existing openings are not adequate. 

 

12) Cleaning procedures shall be in accordance with API 2015, incorporated 

by reference in 41 Ill. Adm. Code 174.210. Protective respiratory 

equipment for tank cleaning personnel shall be the type that provides 

positive air pressure to a full-face mask throughout the breathing cycle, in 

accordance with API 2015. 

 

13) After cleaning, on-site personnel shall proceed to introduce an OSFM-

approved, inert material through openings in the top of the tank to 

minimize any surface settling subsequent to abandonment of the tank in 

place. Allowed inert material shall be limited to sand, gravel, clay, 

bentonite or inert material mixed with portland cement to increase 

flowability. The portland cement concentration may not exceed 50 lbs. per 

cubic yard of mixed material. Tripolymer foam may only be used on 

compartment tanks where at least 1 compartment is not being abandoned 

in place and will remain in use. Any other materials must be approved by 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12871 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

OSFM during the permit process. The procedure for filling shall be in 

accordance with API 1604.  

 

14) After the tank is filled with inert material, all tank openings shall be 

plugged or capped unless it was necessary to cut open the tank top. The 

vent line shall be disconnected, capped and removed. 

 

15) Every abandonment-in-place requires a site assessment (see 41 Ill. Adm. 

Code 176.330). 

 

16) When a UST is abandoned-in-place, the owner of the UST shall keep a 

permanent record of the UST location, the date of abandonment-in-place 

and the procedure used for abandonment-in-place.  

 

e) When a UST is allowed to be abandoned-in-place, as specified in this Section, the 

abandoned-in-place UST shall be removed when the condition for issuing the 

abandonment permit no longer exists. The removal procedures shall be followed 

and a removal permit is required. 

 

f) Compliance with subsections (d)(1) through (d)(14) is the responsibility of the 

licensed contractor. Compliance with subsections (d)(15) through (d)(16) is the 

responsibility of the owner. 

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12838, effective August 7, 2024) 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12872 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

Section 175.APPENDIX A   UST Activity that Cannot Proceed Without an OSFM 

Inspector on Site 

 

In addition to obtaining a permit pursuant to 41 Ill. Adm. Code 175.300, the UST activities listed 

in this Appendix A will require that the inspection be scheduled with OSFM as an OSI, meaning 

under circumstances where the work cannot proceed in the absence of having an STSS on site.  

(See Section 175.320, regarding scheduling of UST activity.) Proceeding without completion of 

the required OSFM inspection is a violation of OSFM rules. 

 

 

Removal of a UST or UST system, or removal of over 20 feet or 50% of the total piping run or 

an entire underground pipe run 

 

 

Abandonment-in-place, tanks or piping 

 

 

UST hot work/tank entry (if cutting or penetration of tank shell or work capable of providing a 

source of ignition or heat is involved) (See definition of "hot work" at 41 Ill. Adm. Code 

174.100) 

 

 

Lining and lining inspection 

 

 

Installation of a UST or UST system, or installation of over 20 feet or 50% of the total piping 

run or an entire underground pipe run (See Section 175.320(c)) 

 

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12838, effective August 7, 2024) 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12873 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

Section 175.APPENDIX B   The Type of OSFM Permit Required for Specific Permitted 

UST Activities  

 

Pursuant to Section 175.300 and 41 Ill. Adm. Code 174.440 and 174.450, the UST activities 

listed in this Appendix B will require the kinds of permits listed in this chart.  A UST contractor 

portal for the on-line submission of permit applications and the scheduling of permitted work can 

be found at https://webapps.sfm.illinois.gov/USTPortal/Home/Login?ReturnUrl=%2fUSTPortal. 

 

Type of UST Activity Permit Required 

Installation of a complete UST with all 

components, or installation of just the tank 

Installation permit and motor fuel dispensing 

permit pursuant to Section 175.200 

Installation of any portion of a UST (except 

corrosion protection or lining) 

Upgrade permit and motor fuel dispensing 

permit pursuant to Section 175.200 as may 

be applicable 

Removal of a UST or UST system, or removal 

of over 20 feet or 50% of the total piping run or 

an entire underground pipe run 

Removal permit 

  

Abandonment-in-place of any tank or piping Abandonment-in-place permit 

UST repair to make an existing UST part 

functional, but not including lining or corrosion 

protection 

Upgrade permit 

Tank lining or tank lining inspections Lining or interior lining inspection permit 

Emergency repairs (excluding corrosion 

protection) 

Upgrade permit (see the procedures of 

Section 175.710) 

Repair or install cathodic protection or 

corrosion protection, including on flex 

connectors  

Cathodic protection permit 

Manway installation (no separate upgrade or 

entry permit for a manway is required where the 

original lining permit or lining inspection permit 

includes the installation of a manway)  

Hot work/tank entry permit 

UST activity requiring the cutting or 

penetration of the tank shell in any way (no 

separate hot work permit required where a 

lining or lining inspection permit is being 

issued) 

Hot work/tank entry permit 

Installation, upgrade or removal of leak 

detection systems 

Upgrade permit 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12874 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

New spill containment (except that 

replacement of spill containment is a like-for-

like replacement that requires only notification 

to OSFM pursuant to Section 175.300) 

Upgrade permit 

Installation or replacement of a remote fill Upgrade permit 

New or replaced overfill prevention equipment 

(except that replacement of drop tube valves 

are like-for-like replacements that require only 

notification to OSFM pursuant to Section 

175.300) 

Upgrade permit 

Installation or replacement of dispensers where 

piping or any other transitional components at 

or below the shear valve (including the shear 

valve) are replaced at the same time   

Upgrade permit 

Installation or replacement of an ATG unit 

(except that replacement of ATG probes are 

like-for-like replacements that require only 

notification to OSFM pursuant to Section 

175.300) 

Upgrade permit 

Installation or replacement of a flex connector 

(only) 

Upgrade permit 

Installation of wristband anodes or spike 

anodes on an existing flex connector (only) 

Cathodic protection permit 

Installation or replacement of a flex connector 

and wristband anodes or spike anodes on the 

flex connector (only) 

Cathodic protection permit (shall also be 

licensed in the retrofitting/installation 

module) 

Connecting a new or existing bulk load-out to a 

new or existing UST at a motor fuel dispensing 

facility 

Upgrade permit (Installation permit if an 

entire UST is being installed) 

Construction of a building or structure where 

loading or unloading or dispensing operations 

will occur 

Motor fuel dispensing permit pursuant to 

Section 175.200 

Site for the mobile fueling of commercial 

vehicle fleets (pursuant to Section 2(1)(d)(C) of 

the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 

15/2(1)(d)(C)]) 

Mobile fueling site permit (pursuant to 41 

Ill. Adm. Code 174.440 and 174.450) 

Tank vehicle to be used for the mobile fueling 

of commercial vehicle fleets (pursuant to 

Mobile fueling vehicle permit (pursuant to 

41 Ill. Adm. Code 174.440 and 174.450) 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12875 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

Section 2(1)(d)(C) of the Gasoline Storage Act 

[430 ILCS 15/2(1)(d)(C)]) 

Person, company, or other entity proposing to 

conduct mobile fueling using tank vehicles to 

be used for the mobile fueling of commercial 

vehicle fleets (pursuant to Section 2(1)(d)(C) of 

the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 

15/2(1)(d)(C)]) 

Mobile fueling contractor permit (pursuant 

to 41 Ill. Adm. Code 174.440 and 174.450)  

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12838, effective August 7, 2024) 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12876 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

1) Heading of the Part:  Administrative Requirements for Underground Storage Tanks and 

the Storage, Transportation, Sale and Use of Petroleum and Other Regulated Substances 

 

2) Code Citation:  41 Ill. Adm. Code 176 

 

3) Section Numbers:  Adopted Actions: 

176.400   Amendment 

176.470   Amendment 

176.655   Amendment 

 

4) Statutory Authority:  Implementing the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15] and 

authorized by Section 2 of the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15/2]. 

 

5) Effective Date of Rule:  August 7, 2024 

 

6) Does this rulemaking contain an automatic repeal date?  No 

 

7) Does this rulemaking contain incorporations by reference?  Yes 

 

8) A copy of the Adopted Rule, including any matter incorporated by reference, are on file 

in the principal office of the State Fire Marshal, 1035 Stevenson Drive, Springfield, 

Illinois, and are available for public inspection at that location. 

 

9) Notice of Proposal Published in the Illinois Register:  48 Ill. Reg. 3703; March 15, 2024 

 

10) Has JCAR issued a Statement of Objection to this rulemaking?  No 

 

11) Differences between Proposal and Final Version:  The JCAR agreed changes were as 

follows: 

 

--the lead-in to Section 176.400 has been changed to read: 

 

Pursuant to 430 ILCS 15/2, OSFM is authorized to delegate enforcement of its 

UST rules and regulations to any municipality having a population over 500,000.  

Subject to the terms of the delegation agreement, such delegation may include 

permitting, inspections, the completion and issuance of inspection forms and 

notices and enforcement activities regarding UST activities within the jurisdiction 

of that municipality, including assessing and collecting permit fees for the 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12877 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

municipality's own use that would otherwise have been assessed and collected by 

OSFM. 

 

--in subsection 176.400(a), changed "OSFM has oversight concerning this enforcement" 

to "OSFM will maintain oversight concerning delegated enforcement"; 

 

--in subsection 176.400(b), at the end of that paragraph just before the period, inserted 

"under Section 2(1)(a) of the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15/2(1)(a)]"; 

 

--the last sentence of the lead-in to Section 176.470 has been changed to read: 

 

All employees of an OSFM-licensed contractor conducting only inspection and 

testing of UST equipment shall be ICC certified in the installation/retrofitting 

module or shall have other documentation as allowed by subsection (b) (see 

definition of "module" at 41 Ill. Adm. Code 174.100). 

 

--the 4th sentence of subsection 176.470(b) has been changed to read: 

 

For inspection and testing of UST equipment, under 41 Ill. Adm. Code 

172.40(b)(4) the employee of the OSFM-licensed contractor must have a passing 

score on the OSFM-approved exam for the installation/retrofitting module or have 

the credentials and training as required by the manufacturer's recommended 

procedures and instructions.   

 

--the following has been added to the end of subsection 176.470(b) as revised: 

 

The employing licensed contractor may certify the employee has the requisite 

credentials and training. 

 

--subsection 176.470(c) has been changed to read: 

 

Other UST equipment.  Other UST equipment or components or technology that 

are newly developed and not covered by a specific provision of OSFM rules shall 

be evaluated and listed under a national code or standard in accordance with 

Section 176.420.  The equipment, components, or technology must also be tested 

by a certified employee, under 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172.40(b)(4), that has a passing 

score on the required OSFM-approved exam for the installation/retrofitting 

module or has the credentials and training as required by the manufacturer's 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12878 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

recommended procedures and instructions.  The employing licensed contractor 

may certify the employee has the requisite credentials and training. 

 

--in subsection 176.655(b), changed "he or she" to "the Operator"; 

 

--in subsection 176.655(b)(1)(D), at the beginning of the paragraph, changed "That" to 

"Verifying that"; 

 

--subsection 176.655(c)(2) has been changed to read: 

 

Using an employee of an OSFM-licensed contractor for testing or inspection.  

Under 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172.40(b)(4), this employee shall have a passing score 

on the required OSFM-approved exam for the installation/retrofitting module or 

the credentials and training as required by the manufacturer's recommended 

procedures and instructions.  The employing licensed contractor may certify the 

employee has the requisite credentials and training. 

 

12) Have all the changes agreed upon by the agency and JCAR been made as indicated in the 

agreement issued by JCAR?  Yes 

 

13) Will this rulemaking replace an emergency rule currently in effect?  No 

 

14) Are there any rulemakings pending to this part?  No 

 

15) Summary and purpose of rulemaking:  This rulemaking will revise the Illinois 

administrative and technical requirements for underground storage tank systems 

("USTs").  Provides that for licensed UST activities involving the inspection and testing 

of UST equipment, the employee of the OSFM-licensed contractor must be ICC certified 

in the installation/retrofitting module or be certified by the employing licensed contractor 

establishing that the certified employee has the credentials and training as required by the 

manufacturer's recommended procedures and instructions.  Provides that these same 

certified employees would be qualified to conduct testing on other UST equipment or 

components or processes sought to be used for USTs if the item or process sought to be 

utilized is also third-party listed in accordance with 176.420 and passes the required 

testing.  Provides that the annual walk-through inspection by an OSFM-licensed 

contractor can be done by the certified employee of a contractor with licensure in either 

the installation/retrofitting or inspection and testing of UST equipment module.  

Consolidates and makes other non-substantive changes to language concerning the 

delegation of OSFM's authority to enforce its rules within any municipality having a 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12879 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

population of over 500,000, moving that language out of Part 175 and into Section 

176.400.  Makes grammatical and other non-substantive changes.  

 

16) Information and questions regarding this rulemaking shall be directed to:   

 

Tom Andryk 

Division of Legal Counsel 

Office of the State Fire Marshal 

1035 Stevenson Dr. 

Springfield, IL  62703-4259 

 

(217) 785-5758 

Facsimile:  (217) 524-5487 

SFM.USTrulemaking@fdmail.sfm.illinois.gov 

 

The full text of the Adopted Amendments begins on the next page: 

  



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12880 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

TITLE 41:  FIRE PROTECTION 

CHAPTER I:  OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

PART 176 

ADMINISTRATIVE REQUIREMENTS FOR UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANKS 

AND THE STORAGE, TRANSPORTATION, SALE AND USE OF  

PETROLEUM AND OTHER REGULATED SUBSTANCES 

 

SUBPART A:  DEFINITIONS 

 

Section  

176.100 Incorporation of Definitions  

 

SUBPART B:  FINANCIAL ASSURANCE 

 

Section  

176.200 Definitions  

176.205 Applicability 

176.210 Amount 

176.215 Mechanisms of Financial Responsibility 

176.220 Proof of Financial Responsibility 

176.225 Substitution of Financial Responsibility Mechanisms by an Owner or Operator 

176.230 Cancellation or Non-Renewal by a Provider of Financial Assurance  

176.235 Reporting by Owner or Operator (Repealed) 

176.240 Recordkeeping 

176.245 Release from the Requirements 

176.250 Bankruptcy or Other Incapacity of Owner, Operator or Provider of Financial 

Assurance  

 

SUBPART C:  RELEASE REPORTING AND SITE ASSESSMENT 

 

Section  

176.300 Reporting of Suspected Releases  

176.310 Release Investigation Reporting and Site Assessment   

176.320 Initial Response and Reporting of Confirmed Releases 

176.330 Procedures for Site Assessments  

176.340 Reporting and Cleanup of Spills and Overfills 

176.350 Initial Release Abatement Measures  

176.360 Assessing the Site at Removal of, Previously Removed, Abandonment-in-Place or 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12881 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

Change-in-Service of USTs 

 

SUBPART D:  GENERAL TECHNICAL REQUIREMENTS,  

INCLUDING REPORTING, RECORDKEEPING AND NOTIFICATION 

 

Section  

176.400 Delegation of Authority to Enforce UST Rules and Regulations  

176.410 General Requirement to Maintain All Equipment  

176.420 Requirement that UST Components Be Third Party Listed  

176.430 Reporting and Recordkeeping  

176.440 Notification Requirements for Purposes of UST Registration  

176.450 UST Registration Fees  

176.455 Payment of 1988 Annual UST Fee 

176.460 Pre-'74 and Heating Oil USTs  

176.470 Requirements for Conducting Precision Testing of Tanks and Piping, Cathodic 

Protection Testing, and Inspection and Testing of Other UST Equipment  

 

SUBPART E:  HEARINGS AND ENFORCEMENT PROCEDURES 

 

Section  

176.500 Definitions  

176.505 Enforcement Action  

176.510 Grounds and Time for Appeal 

176.515 Notice of Hearing  

176.520 Continuances 

176.525 Appearances  

176.530 Service of Papers and Computation of Time 

176.535 Stipulations 

176.540 Evidence 

176.545 Official Notice 

176.550 Authority of Hearing Officer 

176.555 Default 

176.560 Post-Hearing Submissions 

176.565 Transcripts 

176.570 Final Order 

176.575 License Suspension or Revocation and Assessment of Civil Monetary Fines 

Against a Contractor 

176.580 Assessment of Penalties 

176.585 Subpoena − Fees and Mileage of Witnesses 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12882 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

176.590 Paper Hearings 

 

SUBPART F:  OPERATOR TRAINING 

 

Section  

176.600 Purpose  

176.605 Scope  

176.610 Definitions 

176.615 Class A, B and C Operator Classifications   

176.620 Training 

176.625 Minimum Training Requirements  

176.630 Examination Frequency 

176.635 Approval of Required Training and Examination Location 

176.640 Examination Fees 

176.645 Recordkeeping 

176.650 Out-of-Compliance Retraining 

176.655 Periodic Operation and Maintenance Walkthrough Inspections and Plan; Class A, 

B and C Operator Responsibilities 

176.660 Violations 

 

176.APPENDIX A Derivation Table (Repealed) 

 

AUTHORITY:  Implementing the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15] and authorized by 

Section 2 of the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 15/2].  

 

SOURCE:  Adopted at 34 Ill. Reg. 13485, effective September 2, 2010; amended at 36 Ill. Reg. 

3187, effective February 15, 2012; amended at 42 Ill. Reg. 10621, effective October 13, 2018; 

amended at 47 Ill. Reg. 6949, effective May 2, 2023; amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12876, effective 

August 7, 2024. 

 

SUBPART D:  GENERAL TECHNICAL REQUIREMENTS,  

INCLUDING REPORTING, RECORDKEEPING AND NOTIFICATION 

 

Section 176.400  Delegation of Authority to Enforce UST Rules and Regulations 

 

Pursuant to 430 ILCS 15/2, OSFM is authorizedhas authority to delegate to the City of Chicago 

enforcement of its UST rules and regulations to any municipality having a population over 

500,000.  Subject to the terms of the delegation agreement, such delegation may include 

permitting, inspections, the completion and issuance of inspection forms and notices and 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12883 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

enforcement activities regarding UST activities within the jurisdiction of that municipality, 

including assessing and collecting permit fees for the municipality's own use that would 

otherwise have been assessed and collected by OSFM. 

 

a) The methods and procedures of this enforcement do not have to be identical with 

those of OSFM; however, OSFM will maintain oversight concerning delegated 

enforcementhas oversight concerning this enforcement. 

 

b) Subject to the terms of a delegation agreement, when OSFM is expressly 

authorized to initiate enforcement action, that municipalitythe City of Chicago has 

concurrent authority under Section 2(1)(a) of the Gasoline Storage Act [430 ILCS 

15/2(1)(a)]. 

 

c) The rules and regulations of that municipality regarding UST activities within the 

jurisdiction of that municipality the City of Chicago shall be identical to the 

OSFM rules found atnot be less stringent than 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172174 through 

177. 

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12876, effective August 7, 2024) 

 

Section 176.470  Requirements for Conducting Precision Testing of Tanks and Piping, 

Cathodic Protection Testing, and Inspection and Testing of Other UST Equipment 

 

Employees of an OSFM-licensed contractor conducting cathodic protection testing shall be ICC 

certified in the appropriate module and be licensed by OSFM pursuant to 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172. 

All employees of an OSFM-licensed contractor conducting precision testing of tanks and piping 

shall be ICC certified in the appropriate module or be certified by the manufacturer of the testing 

equipment being used. All employees of an OSFM-licensed contractor conducting only 

inspection and testing of UST equipment shall be ICC certified in the installation/retrofitting 

module or shall have other documentation as allowed by subsection (b) (see definition of 

"module" at 41 Ill. Adm. Code 174.100) certified by the manufacturer of the testing equipment 

being used. 

 

a) Tank precision test methods shall be evaluated and listed by an independent third-

party.  Proof of evaluation and listing shall be demonstrated by the methods being 

published in the NWGLDE publication "List of Leak Detection Evaluations for 

Storage Tank Systems", incorporated by reference in 41 Ill. Adm. Code 

174.210(a).  All tank tightness methods are subject to approval by OSFM.  

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12884 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

b) A certified employee of the OSFM-licensed contractor shall be on site and 

actively supervising the work at all times.  For cathodic protection, that employee 

must be ICC certified in the cathodic protection module exam.  For precision 

testing of tanks and piping, the employee of the OSFM-licensed contractor must 

be ICC certified in the appropriate module specified at 41 Ill. Adm. Code 

172.60(b) or be certified by the manufacturer in the testing of the equipment being 

evaluated for its operation in accordance with manufacturer's specifications. For 

inspection and testing of other UST equipment, under 41 Ill. Adm. Code 

172.40(b)(4) the employee of the OSFM-licensed contractor must have a passing 

score on the OSFM-approved exam for the installation/retrofitting module or have 

the credentials and training as required by the manufacturer's recommended 

procedures and instructionsbe certified by the manufacturer in the testing of the 

equipment being evaluated for its operation in accordance with manufacturer's 

specifications.  The employing licensed contractor may certify the employee has 

the requisite credentials and training. 

 

c) Other UST equipment.  Other UST equipment or components or technology that 

are newly developed and not covered by a specific provision of OSFM rules shall 

be evaluated and listed under a national code or standard in accordance with 

Section 176.420.  The equipment, components, or technology must also be tested 

by a certified employee, under 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172.40(b)(4), that has a passing 

score on the required OSFM-approved exam for the installation/retrofitting 

module or has the credentials and training as required by the manufacturer's 

recommended procedures and instructions.  The employing licensed contractor 

may certify the employee has the requisite credentials and training. 

 

dc) Each tester shall also abide by any other applicable requirements found in 41 Ill. 

Adm. Code 172. 

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12876, effective August 7, 2024) 

 

SUBPART F:  OPERATOR TRAINING 

 

Section 176.655  Periodic Operation and Maintenance Walkthrough Inspections and Plan; 

Class A, B and C Operator Responsibilities 

 

a) At a manned facility, a Class A, Class B or Class C Operator must be onsite at all 

times.  For unmanned facilities, emergency contact information for Class A, B 

and C Operators, including names and telephone numbers, shall be conspicuously 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12885 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

posted at the facility unless a toll-free number for 24 hour dispatch to the facility 

has been prominently displayed at the facility.  At both manned and unmanned 

facilities, the Class C Operator is responsible for responding to alarms or other 

indications of emergencies caused by spills or releases from USTs and shall be 

familiar with the written emergency response instructions and procedures for the 

facility. 

 

b) Periodic Operation and Maintenance Walkthrough Inspections.  Each Class A or 

Class B Operator shall perform walkthrough inspections of each storage tank 

system for which the Operatorhe or she is designated and shall record the results 

of each inspection on a checklist to be maintained with the facility records. At a 

minimum, walkthrough inspections shall be conducted at least once every 30 days 

and once per year, with the results recorded on a checklist that details the 

inspection of the following: 

 

1) At least once every 30 days: 

 

A) Release detection methods, including monitoring systems and all 

associated sensors shall be maintained by: 

 

i) checking to ensure that the entire system is fully 

operational; 

 

ii) checking for potential releases and that there are no alarms 

or any other unusual operating conditions present; and 

 

iii) checking and collecting 30-day Pass reports for ATGs and 

30-day Normal reports for sensors and checking that all 

other required records are reviewed and current; 

 

B) Integrity of spill and overfill prevention and spill containment 

equipment and manholes shall be maintained by: 

 

i) Visually checking for damage, including cracks, holes or 

bulges; 

 

ii) removing all liquid and debris; 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12886 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

iii) checking for a release of regulated substances in all areas of 

the containments, including the interstitial areas of any 

double-walled spill prevention equipment with interstitial 

monitoring; 

 

iv) testing the overfill alarm for operation, if present; 

 

v) checking for and removing any obstructions lodged in the 

fill pipe; 

 

vi) checking to make sure the fill cap is securely on the fill 

pipe; and 

 

vii) checking for all potential sources of water entry; 

 

C) Visually checking dispensers, hoses, breakaways and hardware for 

leaks and damage; 

 

D) Verifying thatThat any impressed current cathodic protection 

system being utilized is operational, checking and recording that 

the power is on and that the voltage, amps and hour meter have the 

appropriate readings required under Section 175.510(f), with a log 

entry that shows date of inspection, initials of inspector, hour, volt 

and amp readings, and power on verification;  

 

2) At least once per year: 

 

A) All containment sumps shall be maintained by: 

 

i) checking for visual damage to the sumps, covers and lids; 

 

ii) checking for the presence of regulated substances or any 

indication that a release may have occurred; and 

 

iii) checking that these sumps and the interstitial areas for any 

double-walled sumps with interstitial monitoring are free of 

water, product and debris; 

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12887 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

B) All UST equipment including emergency stops shall be checked 

for the presence or absence of visible damage to any UST 

component;  

 

C) Documentation that the emergency stops have been tested by the 

owner/operator or a contractor for interconnection and pump 

shutdown shall be submitted and the testing shall comply with the 

following: 

 

i) Checking that activation of any single emergency stop 

results in the shutoff of all switches and pumps; and 

 

ii) Making sure that this is done annually with the OSFM 

certification form completed (the OSFM form titled 

"Certification of Operational Testing of Emergency Stops" 

is available at https://www2.illinois.gov/sites/sfm/About/ 

Divisions/Petroleum-Chemical-Safety/Pages/Applications-

and-Forms.aspx);  

 

D) Documentation that the shear valves have been visually inspected 

by the owner/operator or a contractor shall be submitted and the 

inspection shall comply with the following: 

 

i) checking that the shear valves are located ½ inch above or 

below grade, with grade being the surface upon which the 

dispenser is mounted; 

 

ii) checking that the shear valves are securely mounted using a 

listed rigid anchor device; 

 

iii) checking that the link arm operates when tripped, ensuring 

the poppet valve closes easily; and 

 

iv) Making sure that this is done annually with the OSFM 

certification form completed (the OSFM form titled 

"Certification of Annual Inspection of All Dispenser Shear 

Valves" is available at the website cited in subsection 

(b)(2)(C));   

 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12888 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

E) All required signs are fully visible and all communication systems 

in place and operational;  

 

F) All other daily, 30-day, monthly and annual inspections, testing, 

reporting and records are maintained as required under 41 Ill. 

Adm. Code 174, 175 and 176; and 

 

G) If applicable, the tank gauge stick or groundwater bailers shall be 

checked for operability and serviceability (manual tank gauging or 

groundwater monitoring). 

 

c) Inspection of containment sumps required by subsection (b)(2) shall be 

performed: 

 

1) By an OSFM-licensed contractor that has licensure in the 

installation/retrofitting or inspection and testing of UST equipmenttank 

and piping tightness testing module; and 

 

2) Using an employee of an OSFM-licensed contractor for testing or 

inspection.  Under 41 Ill. Adm. Code 172.40(b)(4), this employee shall 

have a passing score on the required OSFM-approved exam for the 

installation/retrofitting module or the credentials and training as required 

by the manufacturer's recommended procedures and instructionswho is 

certified in the installation/retrofitting or tank and piping tightness testing 

module and also certified by the manufacturer of the equipment being 

tested or inspected and the testing equipment being utilized.  The 

employing licensed contractor may certify the employee has the requisite 

credentials and training. 

 

d) The OSFM 30-day and annual walkthrough inspections checklist is available at 

the website cited in subsection (b)(2)(C). 

 

e) Operations and Maintenance Plan.  UST facility owners and operators shall also, 

in conjunction with their designated Class A and B Operators, adopt and 

implement a written operations and maintenance plan signed by both the owner 

and either a Class A or Class B Operator designated for the UST facility.  The 

plan shall be kept at the facility for the life of the UST and shall be updated to 

reflect changes in the UST facility equipment and operations as they occur.  The 



     ILLINOIS REGISTER            12889 

 24 

OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL 

 

NOTICE OF ADOPTED AMENDMENTS 

 

 

operations and maintenance plan shall be as specific as possible for each facility.  

At a minimum, the operations and maintenance plan shall include the following: 

 

1) A detailed plan showing what inspections, operations, testing, 

maintenance and recordkeeping shall be done on a daily, 30-day, monthly, 

quarterly and annual basis in accordance with OSFM rules. 

 

2) A description of the manner in which UST facility owners and operators 

properly dispose of regulated substances spilled at the facility, including 

any water or soil removed from any part of the UST when there is any 

indication it might be or has been contaminated with a regulated 

substance. 

 

3) The emergency procedures and instructions required under Section 

176.645. 

 

f) The UST facility owner and operator and certified operators shall ensure that all 

inspections and testing, as outlined in the operations and maintenance plan and 

required by this Subpart, are properly performed.  They shall also ensure that the 

work is performed by licensed contractors if required by 41 Ill. Adm. Code 174, 

175 or 176. 

 

g) The certified operators shall provide the UST facility owner and operator with a 

copy of each inspection checklist and alert the owner and operator to any 

condition that requires follow-up actions.  The certified operator doing this shall 

date and initial the 30-day and annual walkthrough inspection checklist, 

indicating that this information has been provided to the UST facility owner and 

operator and a description of the actions taken to correct an issue. The UST owner 

and operator shall promptly address and correct each compliance and maintenance 

item noted as being deficient on the checklist. 

 

h) A Class A, B or C Operator shall not represent himself or herself as certified 

unless the person has a current valid certificate of training from an approved 

trainer. 

 

(Source:  Amended at 48 Ill. Reg. 12876, effective August 7, 2024) 


